Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1. What is your annual IT Infrastructure Budget for 2016, 2017 & 2018? 
Revenue 2016/2017 = £445K, 2017/2018 152K 

2. What storage vendor(s) and model do you currently use? 

NetApp FAS 8040 and 8020.  3PAR 7400.

3. When was the installation date of above storage vendor(s)? (Month/year) 
02/2016

4. When is your planned (or estimated) storage refresh date? (Month/year) 
01/2021

5. What is your estimated budget for the refresh? 

The estimated budget for this has not yet been determined; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6. What is the capacity of the storage data in TB? 
675Tb across all hardware mentioned above.

7. The total number of IT staff employed by the organization:
143.

8. Please list and provide contact details for the IT senior management team including CIO, IT Director and Infrastructure Architects if applicable:
City Information Officer – Carl Skidmore Carl.Skidmore@leicester.gov.uk  Tel: (0116) 4541166.  

Please note that junior staff names are exempt from release under Section 40(2) of The Act as they are personal data, processed for the purposes of employment and the Council judges that disclosure to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair and lawful processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified and not incompatible purposes and this therefore acts as a refusal notice under s.17 of The Act.

9. Please confirm if you are utilising desktop virtualisation technologies and if so how many users do you provide services for? 
We are currently not using any desktop virtualisation technology.

10. What backup software do you use? 
HP Data Protector, NetApp Snap technologies and Microsoft DPM 2012.

11. How much data do you backup in TB? 
Approaching 150Tb

12. Number of servers? 
100 Physical 

13. What operating system(s) do you use? 
Windows 2008, Windows 2012 and Windows 2016. Plus Unix.

14. Number of virtualised servers? 
390 Virtual servers.

15. What percentage of your environment is virtualised? 
80 %

16. If you outsource your IT works, please provide who it is with and when the contract started and ends. 
We do not outsource IT works, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
17. Please also name all of the IT re-sellers that you work with and buy from, as well as the frameworks that you use for the release of any tenders etc. 
We advertise to open market, using www.sourceleicestershire.co.uk, Contracts finder and the Official journal of the European Union where appropriate.
18. Please also approximate the time spent managing your IT systems, specifically storage, per week in the unit of man hours. Also approximate the amount of time taken carving out LUNs and/or 
This would be less than 5 man hours per week.  The time taken to carve out LUNs and Volumes is minutes as and when required.

19. Please list any and all pain points that the IT teams, and organisation as a whole, experience with regard to the storage and usage of the virtualised workloads. 
We are not aware of any pain points; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
20. How is your storage connected, i.e. via Fibre Channel, Ethernet (NFS or ISCSi). If your storage is currently connected via Fibre Channel, do you have access to 10 GB Ethernet, or 1 GB ethernet, and if so, please declare which. 
Storage is Fibre attached over 4Gb and 1Gb.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

