Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Environmental Information Regulations 2004 – asbestos in schools
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:
a.    How many schools your Authority is responsible for?  Answer: 87
b.    How many contain asbestos?  72
c.    The names of the schools that contain chrysotile?  See attached spreadsheet
d.    The names of the schools that contain amosite?  See attached spreadsheet

e.    The names of the schools that contain crocidolite?  See attached spreadsheet

f.     How many system built schools your Authority is responsible for?  13
g.    The names of the schools that are system built, including:

    
i   What type of system building are they?

    
ii  What mark are they?

   
iii When were they constructed?
See attached spreadsheet.  

The Council does not hold the Mark and the Date of Construction for Merrydale Infant School and Mowmacre Hill Primary School.  This therefore is a refusal notice under Section 1.1 of the FOI Act, and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR – information not held by the Council at the time of the request.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
