Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Looked After Children
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:
Could you please provide us with data from each year (i.e. from Jan - Dec 2012, from Jan - Dec 2013, from Jan - Dec 2014, from Jan - Dec 2015, from Jan - Dec 2016) for the following 11 questions: 

1. The number of Muslim children looked after by your local authority. 
Muslim Children in Local Authority care 
Muslim Children in Foster Care
Muslim children with a placement order 
Muslim children subject to child in need (CIN) provision 
Muslim children subject to Child Protection procedures 

2. Looked after Muslim children by Ethnicity 
Black- African
Black - Other Black groups
Indian
Pakistani
Bangladeshi
Middle Eastern 
Eastern European 
Mixed Ethnicities
Other 

3. Looked after Muslim children by Gender 
Male
Female
Other

4. Number of Looked after Sibling groups where one or more child was of 
Muslim heritage 

5.Number of Muslim Children with disability in Local Authority care 
Muslim Children with disability in Foster Care
Muslim children with disability with a placement order 
Muslim children with disability subject to child in need (CIN) provision 
Muslim children with disability subject to Child Protection procedures 

6. Number of Unaccompanied, country of origin and age of Asylum Seekers 
(i.e. Unaccompanied Asylum Seekers - Afghan, Unaccompanied Asylum Seekers - Eritrian 
Unaccompanied Asylum Seekers - Syrian, Unaccompanied Asylum Seekers - Other; Age (0 to 2)(2 to 5), (6 to 10), (11 to 15), (15 to 17), (18 to 21) (staying put arrangements) and (22 to 25) (receiving leaving care support)

7.Could you please provide us data about the reasons Muslim Children are coming into Local Authority care for each year from 2012-2016 . 
One or both parents are deceased 
Relinquished child 
Neglect 
Physical Abuse 
Domestic Violence 
Sexual Abuse 
Emotional Abuse 
Drug or Alcohol Abuse 
Fears of child becoming radicalised

8.Could you please provide us with numbers for each year from 2012 -2016: 
Muslim households applying to foster 
Muslim households successfully completing the assessment stage
Muslim households who have had at least one placement per year 
Average age of Muslim foster carers 
Average age of foster carers in general
Muslim children placed for a period of time with Muslim Foster Carers
Muslim children placed for a period of time with Foster Carers who are not Muslim

9. Please provide data about adoption for each year from 2012 -2016 for Muslim children 
Muslim households applying to adopt 
Muslim households successfully completing the assessment stage 
Muslim households adopting a child 
Average age of Muslim adopters 
Average age of adopters in general 
Muslim-heritage children placed with Muslim Adopters 
Muslim-heritage children placed with Adopters who are not Muslim
10. Please provide data about permanency planning for Muslim children. 
Muslim children who were adopted 
Muslim children who were placed under special guardianship order 
Muslim children who were placed in long-term foster care 
"Muslim children who were placed in kinship care 
Muslim Children in residential care 
Muslim children with other forms of permanency planning 
Average time taken to find a permanent home for Muslim Children 
Muslim children who have experienced disruptions in permanent placement 

11.Please provide us data for all children irrespective of religion or ethnicity- this will allow us make comparisons and to spot patterns of difference and similarity in children's journeys 
Children who were adopted
Children who were placed under special guardianship order
Children who were placed in long-term foster care 
Children who were placed in kinship care 
Children with other forms of permanency planning 
Children in residential care 
Average time taken to find a permanent home for all looked after Children 
Looked after children who have experienced disruptions in permanent placement 

Answer:
Please find attached, information we can provide within the cost limit.  The remaining parts of the request will take well over 18 hour.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. 
This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We hold over 700 records for each year.  To extract all the information requested, we would have to manually trawl through each record which would take approximately 30 hours per year.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

Also, where we have noted in the response that the information is not held, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

NB – Information provided is for financial years and not calendar years as requested. We always record data from April of one year to the following end of March. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


