Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1.      Details of the lowest, highest and average fee hourly rates agreed with external suppliers of the following services for 2017/2018:

a.   Domiciliary care services for the elderly in their own home.
lowest = £13.32                      highest = £14.28                          average = £13.90

b.   Domiciliary care services for adults under the age of 65 in their own home with specialist care needs such as learning disabilities, autism or physical disabilities.

Leicester City Council does not differentiate rates for different service user groups.

(Please note that for questions 1a and 1b, we do not require details of rates paid to individual suppliers, simply minimum, maximum and average rates payable.)

2.      Details of the minimum, maximum and average amount agreed per night for sleep‑in shifts delivered to adults under the age of 65, with specialist care needs.

We have taken this response to mean sleep in shift rates for people requiring domiciliary care. No separate sleep in rate is used; the hourly rates quoted above would be used. 

3.      Details of the percentage increase in hourly fee rates which were awarded to the previous year’s levels.
A flat percentage increase was not applied to providers hourly fee rates. An increase of 43 pence per hour was made to all current providers’ fee rates to cover the changes to the National Minimum Wage and the National Living Wage Supplement from April 2017.

4.      Details of the number of hours provided in the week commencing 24 April 2017 for:

a.   elderly domiciliary care; and
14,477 hours
b.   specialist care (incorporating mental health, learning disabilities, physical disabilities).
Whilst we have a specialist lot for Domiciliary Care, this does not split out the three service user groups as referenced above. Therefore, from the total number of hours of Domiciliary Care commissioned the week commencing 24 April 2017 (which may include, but is not exclusively in reference to, some of the ‘elderly domiciliary care hours’ as identified in Q4a), we have included the total number of hours commissioned for the three respective service user groups requested. These are included below:

Mental Health: 1205 hours

Learning Disability: 544 hours

Physical Disability: 12824 hours

5.      Of the hours listed in answer to question 4, please advise:
a.   what percentage was delivered by the independent sector, 
100% - the data we have access to and have provided is representative of all directly commissioned care (i.e not through a Direct Payment). All directly commissioned care is delivered by the Independent Sector.
b.   what percentage was delivered by the local authority, and 
 0% - no in-house provision.

c.   what percentage was under direct payments/independent budgets.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6.      Total cost in the week commencing 24 April 2017 of the care hours provided by independent providers in both categories of care.

We are not able to answer this question as invoices are submitted for monthly periods only, we would not be able to pinpoint the specified cost for the week requested. 
Our finance team are still awaiting and in the process of progressing payments for invoices for the period in question, therefore, at this time we cannot provide the information for the month which includes the week commencing 24 April 2017.
This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not currently held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

