Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1. Who are your Tier 1/preferred independent fostering providers and what are their corresponding Ofsted ratings and their standard weekly fee per child per week? 
We do not have any preferred providers; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
 
2. What is the pay/allowance range for your foster carers? 
£126 to £185 and £0 to £440

3. Have you placed any Muslim children in the past 24 months? If so, how many? 
126

4. What are the ages, gender, ethnicity of the Muslim Children placed with Muslim or Non Muslim Foster Families in the past 24 months? 
74 had placements with foster carers 

See tables below

	Gender 
	LAC 

	Female 
	33

	Male 
	41

	Total 
	74


	Ethnicity 
	LAC 

	A3 - Any other White background
	4

	B2 - White and Black African
	3

	B3 - White and Asian
	2

	B4 - Any other mixed background
	8

	C1 - Indian
	14

	C2 - Pakistani
	8

	C3 - Bangladeshi
	2

	C4 - Any other Asian background
	11

	D2 - African
	12

	D3 - Any other Black background
	4

	E2 - Any other ethnic group
	6

	Total 
	74


	Age 
	LAC 

	Under 1 
	3

	1 to 4 
	10

	5 to 9 
	24

	10 to 15 
	21

	16 + 
	16

	
	74




5. Have you placed any Muslim children with non-Muslim carers in the past 24 months? If so, how many? 
36

6. Do you employ any Muslim social workers? If so, how many? 
This information is not collected or held by the Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

7. Do you have any Muslim foster carers? If so, how many? 
37 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

