Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. The current average number of weekly hours commissioned to private domiciliary care providers for Adult Social Care as of August 2017 

The average number of weekly hours commissioned as of August 2017 = 16,833.39 

2. The estimated Annual Spend commissioned for Adult Domiciliary Care through private domiciliary care providers (Based on 2016) 

2016-17 Annual Spend commissioned for Adult Domiciliary Care through private domiciliary care providers = £12,778,201

3. The type of agreements held with private domiciliary care providers commissioned to deliver Adult Social Care services such as frameworks, Spot Contracts, Block Contracts etc and their start/end dates 

Our current commissioned Domiciliary Care arrangements operate on a Framework Agreement. 
The contract start date is: 09/10/2017 and the end date is: 09/10/2022 plus possible extension clauses (+1 +1).


	Provider

	Adaptus Carers Limited

	Carewatch Care Services Ltd

	Ark Home Healthcare Ltd

	Aspire UK

	Bluewood Recruitment Ltd

	Bonney Care Agency

	Care 4U (Leicestershire) limited

	Carers Direct Homecare Ltd

	Castlerock Recruitment Group Ltd (CRG Homecare)

	Choices Care Ltd

	Direct Health (UK) Limited

	Domiciliary Care Services (UK) Limited

	English Rose Care Ltd

	Evolving Care Limited

	Family Care Agency Ltd

	Fosse Healthcare Ltd

	Help at Home

	HH Care Limited - Meadows

	Mi Life Care Services Limited

	Nationwide Care Services Ltd

	Nestor Prime Care Services Limited ta Allied Healthcare

	Private Home Care UK LTD

	Sevacare UK Ltd

	UK Care Team Ltd

	Universal Care Services (UK) Limited

	Westminster Homecare Limited


4. The lowest and highest (based on the standard daytime week day rate) charge rates per hour of domiciliary care charged to the local authority for Adult Social care commissioned through private domiciliary care providers 

The lowest and highest hourly rates are £13.61 and £14.69.

5. When you anticipate retendering for domiciliary care services for Adult Social Care

As per the data above, our new framework has just gone live, and as such we will be looking to recommission services from 2022 (or 2023/2024 if extensions clauses are exercised).

6. The names of the current Domiciliary Care Providers commissioned in your authority to deliver Adult Social Care 

Please see the response to question 3.
7. The contact Name, Email address and Contact number of the person responsible for commissioning domiciliary care services in your authority 

Kate Galoppi - Head of Service, Strategic Commissioning (Adult Social Care). 
Tel: 0116 454 2373  Email: Kate.Galoppi@leicester.gov.uk
Sally Vallance - Joint Integrated Commissioning Board Lead Officer. 
Tel: 0116 454 4412  Email: Sally.Vallance@leicester.gov.uk 

8. Are commissioned providers required to use real-time electronic monitoring to provide data to the local authority and if so which system?

Yes, all services we contract with that provide Domiciliary Care are required to use electronic care monitoring to provide data.

As part of the tendering stage providers were required to demonstrate that their ECM system would be compliant with our specifications. This will then be monitored through the contract management of the service. However, Leicester City Council did not specify a particular system for providers to use. 

9. The number of service users currently receiving a direct payment within your local authority as well as the number of average hours per week.

We currently have 1863 service users receiving a direct payment. 
The Council does not hold information regarding the average hours per week.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
10. Is the local authority working with health partners to commission health funded care?

Our recently commissioned framework was procured jointly between the local authority and health partners

11. The authorities’ current market positioning statement for Adult Social Care

Link to Leicester City Council Adult Social Care Market Position Statement 2017-18: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/183806/adult-social-care-market-position-statement-2017-2018.pdf 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

