Freedom of Information Act 2000 – outbound mail
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested. 
You asked:
1)
How does your organisation pay for postage on outbound mail?

Answer:

· Franking machine

· Royal Mail PPI or OBA account

· Downstream Access provider

· Hybrid Mail solution
2)
Please advise how you manage any mailshots.

· In-house using manual mail production and apply postage by franking machine

· Outsourced to a mailing house for print, fulfilment and postage

· A combination of the above, depending on the number of recipients and mail piece content

3)
Are you aware of total spend per piece for outbound mail, including printer costs, pre-printed stationery, any folding or inserting machine costs, envelopes, franking machines (and consumables,) staff resources and energy costs? 
Costs are spread across all departments and not recorded. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

· 1st class (single page colour, simplex) 55p per letter
· 2nd class (single page colour, simplex) 8P per letter

· Large letter (5 pages colour, duplex) 1st Class 85p and 2nd Class 65p
4)
What is your overall spend on outbound mail pa? 

£300,000 - £350,000 p.a.
5)
When will you next review your outbound mail process and/or suppliers? 

It is reviewed annually in line with the Council’s channel-shift agenda 
6)
How do you ask potential suppliers to engage with your organisation to introduce products or services?

Through a formal procurement process

7)
Do you use a tendering website or purchasing consortium? If so, please specify 

If a procurement is determined as needed, then we advertise on www.sourceleicestershire.co.uk as well as Contracts Finder and OJEU if applicable.  We do not use a purchasing consortium.  

8)
Are you bound to purchase from a CCS Registered Supplier (if any cost thresholds apply, please specify.) 

No

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

