Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 I am seeking the following information please:

1.       The total number of fines issued for unauthorised absences from school

2.       The number of these fines that were paid
3.       The total amount of money in pounds that was collected via these fines for unauthorised school absences

(The fines I refer to are explained here: “Your local council can give you a fine of £60, which rises to £120 if you don’t pay within 21 days. If you don’t pay the fine after 28 days you may be prosecuted for your child’s absence from school.” https://www.gov.uk/school-attendance-absence/legal-action-to-enforce-school-attendance)

I would like the three pieces of information explained above for the academic years 2016-17 AND 2015-16 please, ideally in a table format as follows:

	Year
	1.Total number of fines issued
	2. Number of fines that were paid

	3.Total amount of money collected via fines

	2015-16
	3,404
	2,946
	180,000

	2016-17
	2,841
	2,423
	153,000


Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 I am seeking the following information please:
1.       The total number of refunds requested for fines issued as a result of unauthorised absences from school

2.       The number of these refund requests that were granted (i.e. how many of the people who had been fined had any money returned to them)

3.       The total amount of money in pounds that was refunded for fines for unauthorised absences from school

 

(The fines I refer to are explained here: “Your local council can give you a fine of £60, which rises to £120 if you don’t pay within 21 days. If you don’t pay the fine after 28 days you may be prosecuted for your child’s absence from school.” https://www.gov.uk/school-attendance-absence/legal-action-to-enforce-school-attendance)

 

I would like the three pieces of information explained above for the academic years 2016-17 AND 2015-16 please, ideally in a table format as follows:

 

	Year
	1.Total number of refunds requested
	2.Number of refunds granted
	3.Total amount of money refunded 

	2015-16
	Not recorded in reportable format 
	 32
	1,920

	2016-17
	Not recorded in a reportable format
	 12
	780


Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The information requested is not held in a reportable format. This data, if held, would be recorded on an individual’s case file and would require the manual trawl of over 2,000 records. Allowing 5 minutes for each record would exceed the appropriate 18 hour limit.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

Answer

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

