Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. The Home Office report: Action Against Hate, 2016, indicates that public transport is a key area of concern for hate crimes being conducted toward people with disabilities. What action is your organisation taking to reduce hostility and abuse against people with disabilities on your public transport services in your area?
Bus operators are responsible for the safety and welfare of passengers on their services. We are aware that disability awareness training is included in regular driver training modules. However, public order issues on public transport would be managed and reported by the operator or reported by the injured party.  
Therefore, the Council does not hold this information and this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
The City Council owns and manages the Haymarket and St Margaret’s Bus Station, therefore the following responses relate to staff, training and procedures in place at the above sites. 
In order to deter and deal with anti-social and criminal behaviour Security Industry Authority (SIA) accredited Security Guards are present at both Bus stations daily at appropriate times. Council staff working at the bus stations receive appropriate training.

2. Please send me your policies and strategies for dealing with the potential for hostility and abuse against people with disabilities on public transport services in your area.
There are no specific policies; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. What training interventions do you stipulate or suggest to help public transport staff be aware of, and manage, the potential of hostility and abuse against people with disabilities on public transport services in your area?
Our training for staff includes compulsory completion of an online equality and diversity module which is periodically refreshed. Our probation review and annual appraisal process includes questions around equality and diversity. When recruiting our bus station staff our interview questions include scenarios to gauge the candidates approach to equalities. 

4. How does your organisation raise awareness of the possibility of hostility and abuse against people with disabilities on public transport services in your area?
At the request of Community Safety colleagues and/or Police posters promoting reporting of abuse against people because of disability, race or gender have been displayed at the Bus Stations. 

5. Please send to me your published equality objectives in relation to public transport provision in your area and clarify how you make these objectives accessible to the public.
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.  Please access the link below.

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/177370/summary-of-the-equality-and-diversity-strategy.pdf 

We will actively prosecute abuse and have had two examples from 2017 where this has successfully progressed through the courts, one resulting in a diversity awareness course and the other a restraining order. We engage with organisations supporting minority groups through the Bus User Panel.

6. Please send me any progress that you have made toward meeting equality objectives concerning public transport in your area. 
Operators have introduced low floor accessible buses ahead of, and in compliance with, legal requirements. Organisations representing disability groups are consulted and are represented on the bus User Panel.

 
7. Please clarify how you incorporate the Public Sector Equality Duty in your provision of public transport including when contracts are agreed with contracting service operators? 
Leicestershire County Council contracts supported bus services on behalf of the City Council in accordance with its compliant contracting procedures. 


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

