Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Gambling Licences 

Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information.
You asked:

1) Please provide names & addresses of all licensed gambling and/or similar outlets operating within Leicester City Council`s jurisdiction from January 2016 to present. Please also state where these are located and (if possible) when licenses to operate were issued.

Answer:

This information is available on the Council’s public register at: 
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/business/licences-and-permits/public-register/
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain.
2) Please provide names of organisations that offer support and help for those affected or addicted to gambling for the same period above. Please state type of service provided e.g. walk in, telephone service etc.

3) Please provide number of ATMS (Automated Teller Machines) within Leicester City Council`s jurisdiction that charge a fee for cash withdrawals and state location(s).In the same locations, please also state how many ATMs are available that do not charge a fee.

With regard to questions 2 and 3 above, the information is not held by the Council.  Leicester City Council does not provide these services.    Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

