Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Evictions and Out-of-Area Rehousing of Council Tenants affected by Welfare Reform

Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
I am seeking information about the potential impact of central government welfare reform policies on eviction rates and geographical displacement of households with council housing tenancies. My information request relates to three welfare reform policies:

- Under-Occupancy (also known as Removal of Spare Room Subsidy / Bedroom Tax)

- The Benefit Cap

- Universal Credit roll-out

1. Please provide an annual breakdown since April 2010 of the total number of unique council tenancies - including the total number of people recorded as living in them - that have been evicted due to the non-payment of rent arrears.

Answer:

The number of unique evictions carried out due to non-payment of rent by financial year is provided below. 
The number of people recorded as living in them is not available because we are not currently updating our systems with household details.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2016/17                54

2015/16                52

2014/15                103

2013/14                68

2012/13                51

2011/12                52

2010/11                46


2. For each year of this annual breakdown since April 2013, please disclose how many of these evicted households - including the total number of people recorded as living in them - had at some point been affected by:

We have no evictions carried out as a result of benefit income cap up to year ending 2016/17, however, please see information below regarding evictions affected by some degree of under-occupancy. Please note that these evictions may have taken place due to other combined factors and not solely due to non-payment of under occupation charges.  

a) April 2014 to March 2015 – 13 households 

b)
April 2015 to March 2016 – 2 households 

c)
April 2016 to March 2017 – 6 households
A total number of 3 evictions took place in the year April 2016 to March 2017 all of which were either in receipt of Universal Credit or had previously been affected by Universal Credit.  
a. Under-occupancy - as above

b. Under-occupancy and the Benefit Cap - as above

c. Under-occupancy and the Benefit Cap and Universal Credit roll-out - as above 

3. How many of the evicted households affected by a, b, or c - including the total number of people recorded as living in them - went on to make a successful homelessness application to the local authority?

We do not hold this information in an easily accessible format. To collate the information would exceed the cost limit.

We would need to interrogate data from 3 different systems plus spreadsheet data will need to be used to identify the number of homeless applications made by those evicted and to identify other members within the household.  The household information would need to be determined using a different system and then each tenant / household record would have to be searched individually. 

At an estimate of one hour per eviction, it would take around 21 hours to extract the requested information. 
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending 2.5 working days in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

4. Of these successful homeless applications, please disclose how many households - including the total number of people recorded as living in them - were placed in temporary accommodation in a different local authority area and disclose the destination local authority area in each case.
As above, to collate this information for every eviction will take time and a separate search would need to be conducted for each case which could exceed 18 hours.  This is therefore a refusal under section 12.1 of the Act. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

