Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1)   Breakdown of volumes of contact (15/16 and 16/17) for the following channels:
·         Face to face
We do not hold statistics for face to face contact for the full year 2015/2016

Between June 2015 and 31st March 2016 Customer Support received 73453 contacts face to face

In 2016/17 Customer Support received 95074 contacts face to face

·         Telephone
In 2015/16 Customer Support received 681270 contacts by telephone

In 2016/17 Customer Support received 748853 contacts by telephone

·         Web
We collect statistics for the leicester.gov.uk site only.  The figures for December ’17 were:

	Sessions: 294K

	Users: 191K

	Page Views: 685K


These figures are indicative of our overall monthly website usage year in/out.
We do not track the usage of any other Leicester City Council websites; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2)   For 2016/17, please provide a breakdown of contact by the following type of transaction: 
·         Application – e.g. applying for services or career opportunities; 

·         Payments – e.g. paying for a range of fees, fines or taxes; 

·         Tracking – e.g. monitoring progress service requests and applications; 

·         Booking and reservations – e.g. making appointments with the council, and booking items and events; 

·         Renewals – e.g. renewing items like permits and licences; 

·         Reporting – e.g. notifying the council of problems and issues that need addressing; 

·         Finding information – e.g. locating and requesting information on local services and tourism.
We do not hold statistical information about the transaction type of each enquiry. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3)       For 2016/17, breakdown of telephone enquiries by your services or service areas (e.g. revenues and benefits, parking, housing, planning etc).

I understand that this type of statistic is widely captured by local authorities, but if you are not able to provide a breakdown to match the above, I’m more than happy to receive your standard breakdown of contact data.

The breakdown of telephone enquiries for 2016/17 by service/service area received by Customer Support is as follows:

	Service
	2016/2017

	General Enquiries Calls
	75373

	Parking, Bus Passes & Blue Badges Calls
	10427

	Environment Calls
	26996

	Parks Calls
	3942

	Waste Calls
	56001

	Registrars Calls
	11236

	Marriage Transfer Calls
	90

	Electoral Registration Calls
	14250

	Local Taxation Tier 1 Calls
	58406

	Council Tax Tier 2 Calls
	60738

	Housing Benefits Tier 1 Calls
	61147

	Housing Benefits Tier 2 Calls
	38252

	Housing Repairs Calls
	113548

	Housing Repairs High Priority Calls
	1180

	Housing Management Calls
	36516

	Payment & Rent Enquiries Calls
	25074

	Housing Options Tier 1 Calls
	41361

	Housing Options Tier 2 Calls
	18200

	School Admissions Calls
	19860

	General Enquiries Switchboard Calls
	28624

	Social Services Switchboard Calls
	47632


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

