Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

Environmental Information Regulations (EIR) – Ash Dieback 

Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1) What assessment has the council made of the potential impact of ash dieback (Chalara) in the authority area and what strategy does it have to cope?

Answer: No specific assessment has been made by the council to date. 
The council does not have a specific strategy in place. Therefore this is a refusal notice under section 1.1 of the FOIA and regulation 12 (4) (a) of EIR – information not held by the Council.

2) How many mature ash trees are close to roads for which the council is responsible or public areas in the council’s control where those trees have the potential to impact on public safety if they become infected, whether in the council’s ownership or privately owned?
This information is recorded only on a site by site basis so to collate the information requested would take an amount of time that would exceed the ‘appropriate limit’ for costs as set out in section 12 of the FOIA and EIR.
The appropriate limit specified in regulations for the Council is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending 18 hours (2.5 working days) in determining whether the department holds the information, and locating, retrieving and extracting the information.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under the provisions of FOIA section 12.1 (over the limit) and EIR reg. 12 (4) (b) (is manifestly unreasonable). 
3) How many of those trees are on council-owned land, and how many of those are ‘street trees’ in residential areas.

For the first part of the question see above. 
For the second part, ash of all species and varieties growing on the adopted highway = 582

4) How many of those trees are on non-council-owned land?

None
5) What is the estimated cost to the council of felling and/or otherwise dealing with all trees in question 2 and over what timescale is that cost estimated?

This information is not held by the council.  Therefore this is a refusal notice under FOIA section 1.1 and EIR regulation 12 (4) (a) – information not held. 

6) How much of that cost does the council expect to recover from third parties?

N/A
7) How many trees has the council committed to plant specifically to replace trees lost to Chalara?

None at present
Please note that Leicester City Council does not take direct responsibility for trees it does not own.  It only moves into such areas under very specific circumstances.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

