Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. How many public toilets were maintained by your council on:
a. 1st April 2010 (or nearest date where records are kept) 
30
b. 1st April 2011 (or nearest date where records are kept) 
30
c. 1st April 2012 (or nearest date where records are kept)
30
d. 1st April 2013 (or nearest date where records are kept)
30
e. 1st April 2014 (or nearest date where records are kept)
30

f. 1st April 2015 (or nearest date where records are kept)
31

g. 1st April 2016 (or nearest date where records are kept)
32
h. 1st April 2017 (or nearest date where records are kept) 
33

i. 1st April 2018 (or nearest date where records are kept)
33

2. Please provide the postcodes/address of each of the public toilets maintained by your council on:
a. 1st April 2010 (or nearest date where records are kept)

	Location
	
	 Postcode

	 
	Newarke Street 
	LE2 7AD

	 
	Leicester Market 
	LE1 5HQ

	 
	Haymarket Public Convenience
	LE1 3FT

	 
	Haymarket bus station 
	LE1 1FB

	 
	St Margaret's bus station 
	LE1 3AG

	 
	Abbey Park (4 toilets)
	LE4 5AQ

	 
	Aylestone Hall Gardens 
	LE2 8FS

	 
	Braunstone Park 
	LE3 1HX

	 
	Evington House 
	LE5 6DF

	 
	Humberstone Park 
	LE5 4DG

	 
	Knighton Park 
	LE2 3YQ

	 
	Spinney Hill Park
	LE5 5AY

	 
	Western Park
	LE3 0WA

	 
	Belgrave Cemetery
	LE4 3EX

	 
	Gilroes Cemetery
	LE3 9QJ

	 
	Saffron Hill Cemetery
	LE2 6TY

	 
	Welford Road Cemetery
	LE2 6BF

	 
	Beaumont Leys Market
	LE4 1DF

	 
	Belgrave Road
	LE4 6AR

	 
	Clarendon Gardens 
	LE2 3AJ

	 
	Cossington Street 
	LE4 6JD

	 
	East Park Road 
	LE5 5HL

	 
	Infirmary Square 
	LE1 5UE

	 
	Foundry Square 
	LE1 3HT

	 
	Knighton Lane 
	LE2 8BE

	 
	Park & Ride 
	LE3 3LF

	 
	Welford Road 
	LE2 7TR


b. 1st April 2018 (or nearest date where records are kept)

	Location
	Postcode

	Newarke Street 
	LE2 7AD

	Leicester Market 
	LE1 5HQ

	Haymarket Public Convenience
	LE1 3FT

	Haymarket bus station 
	LE1 1FB

	St Margaret's bus station 
	LE1 3AG

	Abbey Park  (4 toilets)
	LE4 5AQ

	Aylestone Hall Gardens 
	LE2 8FS

	Braunstone Park 
	LE3 1HX

	Evington House 
	LE5 6DF

	Evington Park
	LE5 6DF

	Humberstone Park 
	LE5 4DG

	Knighton Park 
	LE2 3YQ

	Spinney Hill Park
	LE5 5AY

	Victoria Park 
	LE1 7RY

	Watermead Country Park South
	LE4 7RN

	Western Park
	LE3 0WA

	Belgrave Cemetery
	LE4 3EX

	Gilroes Cemetery
	LE3 9QJ

	Saffron Hill Cemetery
	LE2 6TY

	Welford Road Cemetery
	LE2 6BF

	Beaumont Leys Market
	LE4 1DF

	Belgrave Road
	LE4 6AR

	Clarendon Gardens 
	LE2 3AJ

	Cossington Street 
	LE4 6JD

	East Park Road 
	LE5 5HL

	Infirmary Square 
	LE1 5UE

	Foundry Square 
	LE1 3HT

	Knighton Lane 
	LE2 8BE

	Park & Ride 
	LE3 3LF

	Welford Road 
	LE2 7TR


3. What was the annual cost of maintaining the public toilets run by your council in the financial year 2017-18?
Leicester City Council does not manage the public conveniences as a separate cost centre for repairs, maintenance and cleansing.  We are therefore unable to break down this spend as requested. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. What is the overall expenditure by your council on public toilets for each financial year from 2010-11 to 2017-18? (Please give an annual breakdown.)
Leicester City Council does not manage the public conveniences as a separate cost centre for repairs, maintenance and cleansing.  We are therefore unable to break down this spend as requested. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

