Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. How many staff (either volunteers or paid staff) delivering workshops in all Leicester City Libraries where the workshops are specifically for young people aged between 3-19 years of age are:
a) Female
b) of Ethnic origin - any ethnic background will suffice

Sessions identified: After school “Study Support” sessions, Toddler Time Sessions for under 5yrs, Summer Reading Scheme sessions during June – August.

Information held for Leicester City Council paid staff:

a) Female = 30 members of staff (96.7%)

b) of Ethnic origin = 75%

This information is not held for volunteers; therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Please provide a breakdown of how many staff are paid (either by the Library service or other funding), how many are volunteers, and for illustrative purposes, the percentage ratio of male to female workshop delivery staff, and the percentage of workshop delivery staff with an ethnic background versus those of a non-ethnic or white British background.

For the purposes of this request, those of a transgender or non-binary disposition should be excluded from all results, unless they have fully transitioned to either gender. 

“Study Support” sessions and Toddler Time Sessions for under 5yrs: 
31 members of staff employed by Leicester City Council.  No formal volunteers.

Summer Reading Scheme 2017: (Seasonal) – 37 volunteers involved in delivery of workshops.  Information not held regarding ethnicity and gender of volunteers, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

