Freedom of Information Act 2000 – compensation claims due to poor road conditions
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
Please kindly provide us with details of compensation payments for damage caused due to poor condition of roads (potholes, etc.) by year from 1990 to 2015 inclusive.

1. Total claims for compensation your council received for year. 

For requests 2-6 (below) we would like this to be based on when the damage occurred. For example if the damage occurred in 1998 we would prefer the amount paid to appear in the 1998 column and so on. If you cannot arrange the data in this way then please kindly base it on the year the claim was made. For instance if the claim was made in the year 1999 then kindly arrange for the amount paid to appear in 1999. If however you are again unable to arrange the data in this way then kindly provide it in any available way stating how it is arranged.

It is our preference for these figures to include fees (such as legal fees). If this is not possible then please kindly provide the data anyway and state what is included.

2. Total claims your council paid out compensation for year. 

3. Highest single amount paid out in compensation for year. 

4. Lowest single amount paid out in compensation for year. 

5. Average amount paid out in compensation for year. 

6. Total compensation paid out for year.
Answer: 
Please find attached file with data we can provide.
1. We do not hold information prior to 1998.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. We cannot provide lowest single amount paid as our system does not pick up minimum amount (returns 0 as a value). 
3. Figures include all costs (damages, own and third party legal fees).
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

