Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Full Fibre telecoms infrastructure 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
I am conducting some research into the amount of competitive ‘Full Fibre’ (“Fibre-to-the Home/Premise”) telecoms infrastructure being built across the country, region by region.   Please could you answer the following questions:
1. Number of Applicants to build Full Fibre networks in your area:
For the avoidance of doubt I am interested in the number of applicants (rather than the total applications) in your area (either received or prospective). Eg if  BT Openreach applies for say 5 projects, and (say) “CityFibre” 2 projects, and “Infracapital” 1 project, then the total would be 3 (rather than 8).

Answer:  The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Local Authority resources dedicated to full fibre 
No “dedicated” resource; one part time officer
Out of 10 (1 lowest / 10 highest) how would you rank Full Fibre as a priority?

8
3. How would you best describe the Authority’s geography/population density?

Urban

4. Would you give approval for a road to be dug up if another operator had already dug up that particular road?

Yes we would normally allow a road to be excavated if another operator had been in the area. We would normally be proactive with utilities to avoid this where possible. Preventing this would require a Section 58a restriction.

Does Virgin Media operate in the area?       

Yes, Virgin Media operate in the area, however there are currently no major schemes taking place by them in the City of Leicester.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

