Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Internal Audit 5 yearly review
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:
Legislation requires a 5 yearly external assessment of internal audit services, as per link.

Please will you provide the following 

1. The process you went through or are going through to meet the requirements to include -

2. Recorded information and reports to committees ahead of the audit, dates, which committee, selection of supplier etc.

3. The process of the inspection, who interviews timescales etc. 

4. The supplier who undertook your inspection and the Terms of reference

5. The completed report and action plans and where and when it was reported, any follow up reports and cost.

6. If your internal audit service provided this service to any other local authority in s reciprocal or other arrangement. 

http://www.cipfa.org/services/advisory-and-consultancy/psias-external-assessment

Answer: 
The City Council has formally delegated the internal audit function to Leicestershire County Council, and no longer operates its own service.  The information is not held by the Council and advising you as such, as required by Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  
Please direct your request to Leicestershire County Council at foi@leics.gov.uk
A report by the County Council to the City’s Audit and Risk Committee on 13 June 2018, item 10 Peer Review Outcome, has been published on the Council’s website:

http://www.cabinet.leicester.gov.uk:8071/ieListDocuments.aspx?CId=417&MId=8619&Ver=4
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
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