Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Housing applications
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How many people claiming to be homeless has Housing Options refused in the last 12 months on the grounds that they are not eligible for homelessness assistance?

Answer: 43

2. Among the above, what percentage or what number were ineligible due to their immigration status?

100%

3. How many council housing applications has Housing Options refused in the last 12 months on the grounds that LCC does not have duty of care towards them?
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The Housing Register is a register of applicants who have a housing need to move to alternative accommodation such as under occupation/overcrowding and other reasons as set out in the Housing Act 1996 Part VI.  We do not assess whether there is a duty of care as part of this process.

4. Among the above, what percentage or what number where ineligible due to their immigration status?
See above. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
