Freedom of Information Act 2000 – rent arrears from council owned housing
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

1. What were the total rent arrears from council maintained/owned housing for the financial years: (Please supply as both a monetary figure, and a percentage of council homes rental income). 

We have council stock estimated around 21,000 properties. The rent collection rate for 2017/18 was 99.66%. The amounts shown below are total outstanding arrears at the end of each financial year for current tenants, rather than arrear that accumulated over a 12month period.
a) 2015-16 - £1,532,816 
b) 2016-17 - £1,461,354

c) 2017-18 - £1,442,250

2. What is the current average level of arrears, in monetary value, of tenants receiving:
a) Universal Credit 

b) Legacy benefits (the old Housing Benefit); 

Our rent accounts do not currently indicate any other benefit a tenant may be in receipt of, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice in accordance with section 1.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, information not held in relation to Universal Credit.
The average arrears for those on Housing Benefit is £147.08.

3. In your housing accounts, what was the monetary value of bad debt provision (rent that cannot be collected) for the financial years: 
The bad debt provision is based on an assessment of the likelihood that outstanding arrears will be collected, considering both the age and the nature of the debt. Note that this is different to the level of debt that is actually written off in each year. 

a) 2015-16 - £721k
b) 2016-17 - £226k
c) 2017-18 - £243k
4. As part of your future financial planning: 

a) What are the predicted rent arrears levels, (in both monetary terms, and as a percentage of rental income), for 2022 – 2023, (when Universal Credit is expected to have been rolled out across the country)? 

We do not hold the information requested therefore this is a refusal notice under section 1.1 of the Act.  We have no future predicted rent arrear levels and are unable to respond as this would not be factual.
b) Of this amount, how much in monetary terms is “bad debt” –i.e. rent that cannot be collected?  

We do not hold an estimate of the extent to which this debt may have to be written off.  This is therefore a refusal notice under section1.1 of the Act, information not held.
5. How many evictions from council properties (with rent arrears being the primary reason) have there been for the financial years:  

a) 2015-16 - 52
b) 2016-17 - 54

c) 2017-18 - 37

6. Have you undertaken any assessment of the impact of Universal Credit on your current or future finances and services? (E.g. the ability to build new homes, or offer tenant welfare support) If so, then please disclose it.

We will be gathering information from the roll out of Universal Credit and use this to inform the budget-setting process. Changes to levels of income and debt associated with Universal Credit will be considered alongside the other pressures being faced by Housing Authorities.


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

