Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
The time range I am interested in is for each of the three years 2015, 2016, 2017.

Request 1 - Electric Vehicles
1.
Does the local authority have a procurement plan for Electric or other low emission vehicles with a view to replace its current fleet of vehicles with low emission alternatives?

Answer:
In September 2015 the Council’s Fleet Board approved the phased replacement of 110 diesel vehicles with Ultra Low Emission Vehicles (ULEVs).  The City Council has purchased and been operating an initial phase of 15 electric vehicles (EVs) since 2016. Ten Nissan Leaf cars and five Nissan eNV200 vans were purchased; supported by 15 7kW chargers. These joined two Renault Kangoo vans purchased earlier. The plan remains in place to progressively increase the number of electric vehicles in the Council fleet.

The City Council’s Car Salary Sacrifice Scheme encourages staff to make the change to electric, and see how much they can save driving a brand new electric car. Discounts are available on many models, as well as the costs of supplying and installing a charge point. During the years in question this Scheme supported the purchase of 11 Ultra-Low Emission Vehicles, (less than 75g/km of CO₂).

2.
Does the local authority have a plan in place to build increase Electric Vehicle charging points in the local authority area?

‘Healthier Air for Leicester’; Leicester’s Air Quality Action Plan (2015 – 2026) includes a series of actions to address air quality including Action 4: To increase the uptake of ultra low emission vehicles by residents and business. https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/180653/air-quality-action-plan.pdf. To date, Leicester City Council has installed 28 public sockets; four of which were installed in 2017 at the Centenary Walk car park.

Local Plan Policy PS11 – ‘Protection from Pollution’, states; “proposals associated with alternative fuels and technology (such as refuelling and recharging infrastructure) will be supported.”

In current planning permissions, Leicester City Council recommends that new planning applications for more than 80 residences include electric vehicle charging infrastructure. The Local Plan, including this policy is currently under review.

The Council’s current standards for EV charging spaces is contained in Appendix 11 of the City Centre Car Parking Strategy Supplementary Planning Document, 2011. https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/179120/city-centre-parking-spd-march-2011.pdf
Since 2011, as part of the Choose How You Move initiative the Council has been administering the Sustainable Travel Grant for Business. Businesses can apply for grants of up to £5000 – on a match funding basis - to implement changes which encourage staff and visitors to travel by active and sustainable travel modes.  During the years in question, grants were given to support the purchase of five electric vehicle charge points; four in 2015 and one in 2016. http://www.choosehowyoumove.co.uk/advice/business/
In 2017 the City Council began investigations into the possibility of charging cars from lamp columns; in response to grants towards charge points in residential areas being available from the Government’s Office for Low Emission Vehicles. We anticipate that trial installations will take place during the Autumn of 2018. 


Request 2 - Potholes
1.
The number of potholes identified in the local authority.

The number of carriageway defects identified as requiring an urgent repair were:
2015 - 5615

2016 - 4911

2017 - 3868

2.
The number of potholes identified by the local authority that were not filled during the given year.

All defects which are identified as requiring an urgent repair are repaired.

Request 3 - School Buses
1.
The number of school buses operated by or on behalf of the local authority, the Starting and End point of each bus and the length of the route in miles.
The Council’s Public and Transport Service (PATS) does not commission buses from external contractors for routine Special Education Needs (SEN) work. 
All SEN bus transport is provided by our in-house fleet. The quantity of buses active on any given day can vary but in general it is around 63. This has not changed much for the years in question. 
To provide information for start and end point of routes would exceed the appropriate limit (18 hours) as per calculations below:
Quantity of routes = 63

Runs per day per route = 2

Academic weeks per year = 38

Years in question = 3

Therefore the (minimum) quantity of runsheets that would have to be re-generated and checked would be 63 x 2 x 38 x 3 = 14,364.

At 5 minutes to re-generate each run would take 1197 hours to complete. Our environment is very dynamic and prone to volatility so there is no “short cut” to provide this data.  In reality, routes change on a daily basis so no two days are the same. 

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

We do not store the length of any route in miles. The rules say that the pupils may not be on the bus for longer than one hour so this is the target we work towards regardless of the distance the bus actually travels. 

2.
The amount of subsidy (if any) given to each operator to run a school bus service. 

We use no operators so there is no subsidy
3.
The estimated number of school children who use the buses to travel to school in the given years.

600 as an approximate minimum each year

Request 4 - Recycling

1.
The amount of waste local authorities collected in tonnes, broken down by recycling and non-recycling.

All waste collected and disposed of is reported to DEFRA through the WasteDataFlow website. This includes reporting on waste collected for recycling and waste collected for disposal separately. The data submitted is publically available and reports can be downloaded from http://www.wastedataflow.org/  

This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain.
2.
If the local authority exported waste to China during the years listed, how many tonnes of waste was exported to China and how much of the waste in tonnes was recycling and non-recycling?

Leicester City Council does not export any waste. Our contractor, Biffa Leicester Limited, collects and disposes of household waste collected from the city. This includes kerbside collected recycling which is sent to a material recovery facilities for segregation. The material recovery facilities despatches to the segregated recyclates to a number of offtakers, and the material is then sent for further processing in the UK or exported. 
A proportion of the exported materials are likely to have been exported to China. Leicester City Council does not have tonnage data for waste originating from Leicester kerbside collections which has been sent to China following processing at the material recovery facilities. This is therefore a refusal notice under Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.
3.
The distance in miles collected waste is transported to recycling centre, landfill, incinerators etc. and what proportion of waste is transported to those different places.

The destination of all wastes collected and sent to recycling facilities, landfill, incinerators or other treatment sites is reported to DEFRA on the WasteDataFlow website. This includes facility addresses. The data submitted is publically available and reports can be downloaded from http://www.wastedataflow.org/ . 
We do not hold data on the distances on file; distances in miles can be estimated using websites such as google maps. This is a refusal under Section 1.1 of the Act, as we do not hold this information.
Request 5 - Litter Picking

1.
The amount spent by the local authority on litter picking.

We do not have a separate budget for litter picking so this information is not available.  This is a refusal notice in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.

2.
The number of staff employed to pick litter.

Cleansing Operatives carry out a range of duties including litter picking; we do not have staff employed to solely litter pick.

3.
The number of public litter bins in the local authority area.

2,508 (same for each year)

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
