Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Dog breeding licences
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
If the answer is zero, please input '0'. If you do not hold the information, please input 'NA'. 

1. Number of first-time applications for a dog breeding licence, per year from 2006 – 2016.
Answer: 1 in 2007

2. The fee charged for a first-time application, per year from 2006 – 2016 (including and excluding inspection fees).
£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2006/7. 
£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2007/8, 
£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2008/9, 
£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2009/10, 
£131 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2010/11, 

£134 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2011/12, 

£137 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2012/13, 

£139 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2013/14, 

£144 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2014/15, 
£148 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2015/16, 
£155 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2016/16.

3. Number of renewal applications for a dog breeding licence, per year from 2006 – 2016.
1 in 2008, 
1 in 2009, 
1 in 2010, 
1 in 2011, 
1 in 2012, 
1 in 2013, 
1 in 2014, 
0 in 2015, 
0 in 2016


4. The fee charged for a renewal application, per year from 2006 – 2016 (including and excluding inspection fees).

The fees are the same for new and renewal applications, and are in addition to the actual cost of a veterinary inspection.
£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2006/7. 

£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2007/8, 

£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2008/9, 

£129 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2009/10, 

£131 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2010/11, 

£134 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2011/12, 

£137 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2012/13, 

£139 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2013/14, 

£144 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2014/15, 

£148 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2015/16, 

£155 plus vet inspection fees at cost in 2016/16.
5. Number of applications refused for a dog breeding licence, per year from 2006 – 2016 (with reasons for refusal if possible).
NA

6. Number of dog breeding licences issued, per year from 2006 – 2016.
One with renewal in each of years 2007 to 2014.


7. Number of dog breeding licensed establishments with quarantine or isolation facilities, per year from 2006 – 2016. 
Nil.


8. Number of dog breeding licensed establishments, per year from 2006 – 2016, with majority: A) natural light, B) artificial light, or C) a combination of both.
1(C) in 2008, 
1(C) in 2009, 
1(C) in 2010, 
1(C) in 2011, 
1(C) in 2012, 
1(C) in 2013, 
1(C) in 2014

9. Number of dog breeding licensed establishments, per year from 2006 – 2016, with the following accommodation: A) wholly indoors, B) wholly outdoors, or C) a combination of both.
1(C) in 2008, 

1(C) in 2009, 

1(C) in 2010, 

1(C) in 2011, 
1(C) in 2012, 
1(C) in 2013, 
1(C) in 2014.

10. Number of dog breeding licensed establishment, per year from 2006 – 2016, with the following breeding establishments: A) domestic, B) non-domestic, or C) a combination of both.
1(A) in 2008, 

1(A) in 2009, 

1(A) in 2010, 

1(A) in 2011, 

1(A) in 2012, 

1(A) in 2013, 

1(A) in 2014.


More specific questions regarding each dog breeding licensed establishment, per year, from 2006 – 2016:

11. The number, age and breed of all breeding bitches, in each dog breeding licensed establishment.
NA. Our database system holds records regarding the identity and address of individuals issued with dog breeder licences and details of the type of premises; however, we do not hold details regarding the scale of operations.

12. The breed(s) of dog(s) concerned, in each dog breeding licensed establishment.
Old English Bulldog

13. Number of kennels, in each dog breeding licensed establishment.
NA.


14. The total number of dogs kept above 9 months of age, in each dog breeding licensed establishment.
NA.


15. The number of litters produced, at each dog breeding licensed establishment.
NA


16. The total number of puppies born, in each dog breeding licensed establishment.
NA
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

