Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. 
You asked:

1. Please indicate in column how the following functions provided by your authority’s children’s social services are prioritised by your service from 1 – 20 (1 = highest priority, 20 = lowest priority)

2. Please indicate which, if any of these functions are not being provided, or not being adequately provided, due to funding difficulties. 

3. Please indicate which, if any of these functions are not being provided, or not being adequately provided, due to staffing difficulties.

	
	Priority
	funding
	staffing

	Child at risk due to having drug addicted parent
	
	
	

	Child at risk of physical abuse
	
	
	

	Child at risk due to alcoholic parent
	
	
	

	Child who has committed a serious criminal offence
	
	
	

	Child at risk of FII
	
	
	

	Child at risk as child is drug or addict, or alcoholic
	
	
	

	Child with parents recently died
	
	
	

	Child is home educated referred with concerns.
	
	
	

	Child is home educated, referred no concerns 
	
	
	

	Child at risk of sexual abuse
	
	
	

	Child at risk as prostitute
	
	
	

	Child at risk of sexual exploitation
	
	
	

	Child at risk of FGM
	
	
	

	Child at risk as absconded from care
	
	
	

	Child at risk of radicalisation 
	
	
	

	Child with complex needs due to disability
	
	
	

	Child with moderate needs due to disability
	
	
	

	Child at risk of physical neglect
	
	
	

	Child at risk of emotional harm
	
	
	

	Other, please specify
	
	
	


The Council does not hold this information in this format.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Decisions are not made on a scoring basis and priorities for safeguarding children are not determined by funding pressures.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

