Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Council Housing for Care Leavers
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
In relation to care leavers in receipt of council housing and via contractors (Housing Associations / Groups wholly owned by the council) in 2017 or 2016/17

Answer: The following responses relate to those who have been identified as Care Leavers and referred to Housing in the year 2016/17. 
We do not hold records of Care Leavers referred to any other housing provider. This is therefore a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

·         How many have been evicted from their home and what is the amount of rent arrears written off as a result?
No evictions due to rent arrears

·         What is the average and total amount of rent arrears?

For the entire 28 tenants at the end of March 2017 the total rent arrears were £2,327.30 – an average of £83.12

·         What is the average and total amount of Council Tax arrears?

Total Council Tax Arrears were £833.80 – an average of £30.88

For care leavers in 2017 or 2016/17:

·         What is the average and total cost of housing benefit they received?

Total Housing Benefit award for 2016/17 was £33,119.98 – an average of £56.35 per week

·         How many were classified as homeless?

·         How many were classified as a rough sleeping?

·         How many were housed in temporary accommodation (B&Bs, sheltered accommodation, hotels, bedsits), provided by the Council or contractors.

With regard to the above three questions, please be advised that information relating to Homelessness is collated by Central Government from the P1E quarterly returns provided by Local Authorities.  Please see link below to the live tables, which are updated on a quarterly basis. https://www.gov.uk/government/statistical-data-sets/live-tables-on-homelessness
This therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain.
·         Does the council have a policy on whether those who are evicted retain priority housing status or are processed as new applicants. If so, can it be referenced?

Protocol as follows: 
Outcome

This is to enable priority rehousing for young people leaving the care of Leicester City Council’s Children’s Services.

                

Criteria and Evidence Required

A person will be placed in Band One under this criteria where Leicester City Council’s Children’s Services has confirmed the young person is leaving their care and is ready for independent living.

                
A young person who is not yet 18 will require a guarantor/trustee to be identified before they can apply for properties on Leicester HomeChoice.

Procedure
(i)            All referrals will in the first instance be made to the Head Of Service (HOS) by the appropriate Manager for Children’s Services confirming that the young person is leaving the care of LCC’s Children’s Services and is ready for independent living.

(ii)           Priority can be awarded for a care leaver on the first occasion that they are referred to HOS to go on the housing register, as long as the referral is accompanied by proof that the young person is a care leaver, and there is a positive assessment that the young person has the skills to manage an independent tenancy.

(iii)          The referral can be made at any point up to the age of 21 years (or in some cases 24 years if the young person is in Higher Education).

(iv)         Priority for leaving the care of LCC’s Children’s Services can only be given once and cannot be considered again should the independent living accommodation come to an end.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

