Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1.      Details of the lowest, highest and average fee hourly rates agreed with external suppliers of the following services for 2018/2019:

a.   Domiciliary care services for the elderly in their own home.

b.   Domiciliary care services for adults under the age of 65 in their own home with specialist care needs such as learning disabilities, autism or physical disabilities.
Please note that our Domiciliary Care Service Framework does not differentiate by age group. We currently commission two service lots:

· Service Lot 1: Generic Domiciliary Care 

· Service Lot 2: Complex Domiciliary Support

· Our response to each question will differentiate between our two service lots, not by age.

· Service Lot 1: lowest = £14.13, highest = £15.21, average = £14.81

· Service Lot 2: lowest = £14.13, highest = £16.01, average = £15.35

Note: please note that all lowest, highest and average rate fees are indicative fees based on agreed rates with our suppliers, in-line with the question.

(Please note that for questions 1a and 1b, we do not require details of rates paid to individual suppliers, simply minimum, maximum and average rates payable.)

2.      Details of the minimum, maximum and average amount agreed per night for sleep‑in shifts delivered to adults under the age of 65, with specialist care needs.
· Service Lot 1: lowest = £61.06, highest = £128.14, average = £88.55

· Service Lot 2: lowest = £61.06, highest = £133.57, average = £89.73

3.      Details of the percentage increase in hourly fee rates (referred to the answers of points 1a. and 1b. above) which were awarded to the previous year’s levels. 
Our new contractual framework commenced from 09/10/2017, and our new rates applied from this date. Prior to this date, the ‘previous year’ referred to below is representative of our hourly rates from 28 March 2016.

· Service Lot 1: lowest = 9.62%, highest = 9.58%, average = 9.62%

· Service Lot 2: lowest = 2.47% , highest =14.8%, average = 11.34%

Example of methodology: For Service Lot 1: lowest = 9.62%, we used the lowest hourly rate from our previous year, and then calculated the percentage increase to the lowest hourly rate in our current contractual framework.

4.      Details of the number of hours provided in the week commencing 24 April 2018 for:

a.   elderly domiciliary care; and

b.   specialist care (incorporating mental health, learning disabilities, physical disabilities).
Please see below a summary of hours for the week commencing 24 April 2018 (period: 24-04-2018 – 30-04-2018 inclusive)

· Service Lot 1: 17,779 hours

· Service Lot 2: 140.75 hours

Note: please note that the data provided against this indicator is reflective of commissioned Domiciliary Activity. 

Note: this total number of hours is representative of Leicester City Council funded Domiciliary for those directly commissioned from our contractual framework. It does not include Health funded packages or those in receipt of care through a Direct Payment.

5.      Of the hours listed in answer to question 4, please advise:

a.   what percentage was delivered by the independent sector, 
100%
b.   what percentage was delivered by the local authority, and
0% 
c.   what percentage was under direct payments/independent budgets.

0%* (*of the hours listed in Q4). However, we do issue direct payments (for example, in Q1 2018-19, 41.84% of all Dom care packages were issued through a DP).

We are not able to report on the total number of hours provided for service users in receipt of a direct payment, as this will be an agreement between the service user, service provider and direct payment support provider (informed by a social care assessment of needs). We therefore do not hold this data in a reportable format.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not recorded in a reportable format; it is not captured as part of our performance data.  Therefore, the requested information would be recorded on an individual’s case file and would require the manual trawl of each user record.  
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

6.      Total cost in the week commencing 24 April 2018 of the care hours provided by independent providers of:
a.     Elderly domiciliary care; and 

b.     Specialist care (incorporating mental health, learning disabilities, physical disabilities) 

· Service Lot 1:  £263,134.17

· Service Lot 2:  £2,166.29

Note: the costs cited here are indicative costs based on the commissioned hours cited in response to Q4.


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

