Freedom of Information Act 2000 – referrals to independent advocacy under the Care Act 2014
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

1. Please could you provide the name of the advocacy organisation(s) commissioned to provide advocacy under the Care Act 2014 for each the following groups:

i) the adult with (potential) care and support needs,
Answer:

· POhWER Advocacy Support - Physical Disabilities, Older People & NHS 
Complaints
-
Leicestershire Action for Mental Health Project (LAMP) - Advocacy Support - Mental Health

-
Leicestershire Action for Mental Health Project (LAMP) - Independent Advocacy Services for People within HMP Leicester

-
Leicestershire Action for Mental Health Project (LAMP) - Independent Mental Health Advocacy (IMHA)

-
POhWER - Independent Mental Capacity Advocacy (IMCA)


ii) carers of the adult with care and support needs

· Carers of Leicestershire Advocacy & Support Project (CLASP) - Advocacy Support – Carers
iii) young people in transition

· Barnardo’s

iv) carers of young people in transition

· Barnardo’s

2. If you hold data on the number of referrals made, please could you provide information on how many times a Care Act Advocate was arranged within:

Please note: all data within this section has been extracted from local provider data submissions relating to their services. However, please note that this data includes only the following from section 1i and 1ii:
· POhWER Advocacy Support - Physical Disabilities, Older People & NHS Complaints

· Leicestershire Action for Mental Health Project (LAMP) - Advocacy Support - Mental Health

· Carers of Leicestershire Advocacy & Support Project (CLASP) - Advocacy Support – Carers

Please note that the IMHA and IMCA contracts are managed on our behalf by Leicestershire County Council and as such any enquiries relating to these contracts should go to the County at foi@leics.gov.uk.  Also, the split as requested is not requested for our HMP Leicester contract and as such we do not hold this data therefore this is a refusal notice in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.


i. a needs assessment (under section 9); 

2017-18 = 23

ii. a carer’s assessment (under section 10); 

2017-18 = 1

iii. the preparation of a care and support plan or support plan (under section 25); 

2017-18 = 2


iv. a review of care and support plan or support plan (under section 27);

2017-18 = 10


v. a child’s needs assessment (under section 60); 

2017-18 = 0 (these services are commissioned to deliver Adult Social Care only)

vi. a child’s carer’s assessment (under section 62); 

2017-18 = 0 (these services are commissioned to deliver Adult Social Care only)

vii. a young carer’s assessment (under section 65).

2017-18 = 0 (these services are commissioned to deliver Adult Social Care only)

3. If you hold data on the number of challenges to decisions (formal written complaints, number of cases brought for Judicial Review or applications to the Court of Protection) made by advocates, please could you provide this data as well.

In 2017/18 there were 8 formal complaints received via an advocate.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

