Freedom of Information Act 2000 – M B Estate Ltd
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
For M B Estate Ltd 94 Fosse Lane Leicester LE3 9AJ for the following years
2011/2012
2012/2013
2013/2014
2014/2015
2015/2016
2016/2017
2017/2018
2018/2019

1. Number of visits requested by residents by environmental health

Our Regulatory Services do not record visits requested by residents. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

We record complaints/reports/service requests made by residents and actions taken in response to them.  The contacts relate to issues ranging from dogs to noise to housing conditions.  The actions may include visits for a number of purposes such as inspection. 
We are able to provide the following information outlining the number of complaints/reports/service requests recorded on our systems relating to MB Estate Ltd properties located 94 Fosse Lane / formerly Comet Close / St Clements Court.

There were 93 contacts in the period 2011/12 to 2018/19 and 63 relate to housing conditions. 

The breakdown is as follows:

2011/12 - 0
2012/13 - 1

2013/14 - 5

2014/15 - 12

2015/16 - 24

2016/17 - 12

2017/18 - 31

2018/19 - 8

2. Number of notices issued and the reason

Data in relation to years 2011/12 to 2014/15 is not available.  This is a refusal notice in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council


2015/2016 – 1 Notice for housing standards issues
2016/2017 – 12 Notices for housing standards issues
2017/2018 – 5 Notices for housing standards issues
2018/2019 – 5 Notices for housing standards issues
3. Housing Benefits Paid MB


2011/2012 - NIL
2012/2013 - NIL
2013/2014 - NIL
2014/2015 - £12,378.02
2015/2016 - £52,251.88
2016/2017 - £59,488.66
2017/2018 - £79,608.29
2018/2019 - £22,299.58 (up to last payment made 3/8/18) 

4. Council Tax Charged to M B Estate Ltd and the amount outstanding and action the LCC have taken to recover the monies

The information appertaining to this question is not easily accessible as it is not held as a distinct set able to be retrieved or reported on. This would require manual intervention in reviewing each of their accounts from 2011 onwards.  It is estimated that this exercise would take approximately 34.5 hours. This is worked out as:
There are 69 accounts x (6 years (2013 to 2018) on each) = 414/accounts x 5 minutes each = 2070 minutes / 60 = 34.5 hours.
Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 allows a public authority to refuse a request for information where the cost of dealing with it would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450 (equivalent to 2.5 days of work).

In estimating the cost of complying with a request for information, an authority can only take into account any reasonable costs incurred in:

(a) determining whether it holds the information,
(b) locating the information, or a document which may contain the information,
(c) retrieving the information, or a document which may contain the information, and
(d) extracting the information from a document containing it.

The Council has duly determined whether held, located, retrieved, extracted and prepared relevant information to answer your request within the limit specified above.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

However, we can confirm that the current outstanding council tax amounts are:
2011/12              Nil

2012/13              Nil

2013/14              £168.57

2014/15              £5,388.23

2015/16              £7,748.44

2016/17              £8,883.13

2017/18              £5,205.81

2018/19              £5,158.70

Total                   £32,552.88

5. Details of any FPN issued

These are FPNs issued against MB Estates Limited.
2011/2012 - 0
2012/2013 - 0
2013/2014 - 0
2014/2015 - 0
2015/2016 - 0
2016/2017 - 0
2017/2018 – 3 [2 x Environmental Protection Act 2014 s.47; 1 x ASB Crime and Policing Act 2014 s .52]
2018/2019 – 4 [1 x ASB Crime and Policing Act 2014 s.52; 1 x Environmental Protection Act 2014 s.47; 1 x Environmental Protection Act 2014 s.34; 1 x Control of Pollution (Amendment) Act 1989 s.5]

6. Details of any legal action that has or will be taken out

In addition to the above:

a)
We recover the amounts due, where they remain unpaid, through a court order and then referring the debts to enforcement agents for collection.  Billing and recovery action is taken in line with the Local Government Finance Act 1992 and Council Tax (Administration and Enforcement) Regulations 1992.
b)
On 31 January 2018, Leicester City Council served an Enforcement Notice in accordance with the Town and Country Planning Act 1990 upon both the Company and its Directors requiring the following:

· Demolish the third storey extension from the top of block C of the property

· Demolish the fourth storey extension from the top of block B of the property

· Remove all resultant materials from the site of St Clements Court
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

