Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Public Play Facilities
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How many public play facilities (including playgrounds, adventure playgrounds, skate parks, etc.) do you currently have available to the public in your LA area?

Answer:      
219 public play facilities

9 adventure playgrounds

2. What was your total budget for public play facilities (including playgrounds, adventure playgrounds, skate parks, etc.) in each of the following years?

• 2016-17

£345,000 public play facilities (revenue and S106 funding)
£1,075,000 adventure playgrounds

• 2017-18

£385,600 public play facilities (revenue and S106 funding)

£1,075,000 adventure playgrounds

3. What is your expected total budget for public play facilities (including playgrounds, adventure playgrounds, skate parks, etc.) in each of the following years? 

• 2018-19

£344,300 public play facilities (estimated revenue and S106)

£1,023,000 adventure playgrounds

• 2019-20

• 2020-21

The Council does not hold information for the years 2019/20 and 2020/21.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. How many public playgrounds and play facilities were closed in your LA area and what proportion of your total play facilities did this represent, in each of the following years?

• 2016-17

One public play facility closed 

No adventure playgrounds closed

• 2017-18

No public play facility or adventure playgrounds closed
5. How many public playgrounds and play facilities do you expect will close and what proportion of your total play facilities will this represent, in each of the following years?

• 2018-19

None

• 2019-20

• 2020-21


Information for the above two years is not held therefore this is a refusal under exemption section1.1 of the Act.  

Currently there are no plans for any closures.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

