Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

I am writing to request information regarding recorded incidents of violence and abuse in schools by pupils in your LEA in the last five years - between September 12, and today's date.

The information I am requesting is: 

a) the number of recorded incidents of verbal abuse or threatening behaviour against staff by pupils, and any recorded outcome such as exclusion, reporting to the police etc. 

b) the number of recorded incidents of verbal abuse or threatening behaviour against pupils by pupils, and any recorded outcome.

c)  the number of recorded incidents of sexual violence or sexual assault against staff by pupils, and any recorded outcome

d) the number of recorded incidents of sexual violence or sexual assault against pupils by pupils, and any recorded outcome

e) the number of incidents of physical violence against staff by pupils and any recorded outcome 

f) the number of incidents of physical violence against pupils by pupils and any recorded outcome 

g) the number of weapons seized and the type of weapon seized where recorded.

Please find the relevant information below.  Please note that where exclusions relating to sexual misconduct are reported to Leicester City Council these are recorded under one heading, ‘sexual misconduct’.  Information relating to the perpetrator or victim is not held by Leicester City Council, therefore; this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.
We do not hold information regarding the types of weapons seized; this is not reported to Leicester City Council.  Again, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
	EXCLUSION_REASON
	2012/13
	2013/14
	2014/15
	2015/16
	2016/17
	2017/18

	
	FIXD
	PERM
	FIXD
	PERM
	FIXD
	PERM
	FIXD
	PERM
	FIXD
	PERM
	FIXD
	PERM

	Verbal Abuse/threaten to Pupil
	172
	1
	161
	3
	136
	3
	112
	1
	143
	4
	91
	6

	Verbal Abuse/threaten to Adult
	497
	4
	465
	4
	380
	2
	428
	3
	484
	7
	310
	8

	Sexual Misconduct
	22
	1
	32
	0
	22
	1
	20
	0
	26
	2
	22
	2

	Physical Assault against Pupil
	377
	4
	372
	3
	384
	2
	447
	6
	419
	6
	438
	3

	Physical Assault against Adult
	208
	7
	239
	2
	212
	6
	210
	3
	229
	9
	195
	5

	Offensive Weapon
	25
	0
	44
	3
	34
	2
	30
	1
	42
	1
	15
	0

	Grand Total
	1301
	17
	1313
	15
	1168
	16
	1247
	14
	1343
	29
	1071
	24


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

