Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. The criteria for acceptance as a member for active lifestyle scheme as applied to those referred by the GP and Cardiologists.
Interim Prioritisation for Active Lifestyle Scheme (ALS) Referrals – not intended for self-referrals

Aim

The Active Lifestyle Scheme is a Lifestyle Service which aims to support inactive people who suffer from a medical condition, the guidance they require to build sustainable exercise into their everyday lives. Under the supervision of qualified instructors, every customer will receive a personalised programme of activities, support to enable them to take the first steps to becoming physically active and be provided with healthy lifestyle choices. 

The intention of the ALS prioritisation, is to ensure those with greatest health needs, are seen before those clients with lower risk.  All GP and registered health practitioner referrals will go through the Leicester Get Healthy (Lifestyle) hub.  

Higher risk (Priority 1 and 2)

This priority group is for those clients who are inactive and have a greater need of supervision by an exercise referral instructor.  Clients will have a high risk of heart disease, diabetes and stroke.  Clients are triaged and assessed by leisure -centre based exercise referral qualified instructors.  

Criteria Priority 1 - Delivered by REPS level 4 (Cardiac / respiratory rehabilitation)
· Heart Smart - (Known CVD (cardiac, peripheral vascular, cerebrovascular disease) 

· Breathe Easy (Known COPD, interstitial lung disease)

Criteria Priority 2 – Delivered by REPS level 3 GP exercise referral trained instructors. 

· Metabolic - Type 1 and type 2 diabetes, thyroid, renal or liver disease

· Low back pain

· Controlled asthma

· Diagnosed long term condition

· Rehabilitation (physiotherapy referrals)

· Mental Health.

Lower risk (Priority 3)

Those who are inactive but otherwise healthy and /or with lower risk will be offered a brief intervention by a Lifestyle hub advisor and signposted to local opportunities.  .

2. The number of GPs and Cardiologists referrals and applications for membership, and the numbers of accepted and refused applications, for the year 2017 to-date in 2018.

8,247 referred in the period above, of those 7,692 were accepted and 555 customers rejected.

3. The number of applications (a) accepted and (b) refused which relate to those who are currently partaking in regular physical activity with the Leicester City Council and are members of the Leicester sports centres, and respect of the refusals, the criteria/rules applied to justify the refusal and the period before a new application for the active life scheme/the six months free scheme will be considered. 

3a. None.

3b. Out of the 555 rejected applications to the Active Lifestyle Scheme 31 customers had their application rejected due to them currently being an Active Leicester member.

ALS Refusal criteria

· Previous ALS referral.

· Current and active use of Active Leicester Membership.

· Don’t meet medical criteria.

· Contraindications to exercise within a client’s medical history. 


4. Information held by the council relating to the standards of equipment required to be provided in relation to the scheme; and any information related to breaches of these requirements in the current year, to-date.

There are no specific requirements in relation to equipment for the Active Lifestyle Scheme. All fitness equipment is serviced and maintained on a periodic basis to maintain a healthy and safe environment.

5. Information on any complaints, or accident reports, relating to equipment provided in relation to the scheme received in the current year to-date"
In the current year, there are ten accident and incident reports completed for the leisure centres relating to the fitness facilities.  Two of these reports related to actual gym equipment, all remedial action has been completed where required.
6. For the Spence Street sports and Evington Leisure Centres, please provide the copies of OFSTED reports for the year from 2016 to 2018.

These facilities are not OFSTED registered; therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
7. The cost of refurbishment including installing new equipment/fitness suite, two pools and spectator seating for 400 people at the Braunstone sports Centre

There are no current plans to refurbish Braunstone Leisure Centre; therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
8. I would also like to request the dates of any official visits by the mayor to the Spence Street sports centre and Evington Leisure Sports centre including copies of the minutes of those meetings. 

There have been no official visits during the time period you’ve referred to.
9. If the meetings are not minuted then please provide copies of the minutes, notes action points/plans concerns etc that has been recorded. 

As there have been no meetings there are no minutes to provide. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

