Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Houses in Multiple Occupation (HMOs)
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1.
The number of HMOs or multi-lets in your authority under mandatory licensing schemes in 2018, 2017 and 2016
Answer: 

May 2018


May 2017


February 2016

415



404



379

2.
If available, the number of HMOs which should fall under the current and outgoing mandatory licensing requirements, which you know or suspect are unlicensed
3.
If held, the number of HMO or multi-let properties which will not require a mandatory license following from 1 October 2018, when The Licensing of Houses in Multiple Occupation (Prescribed Description) (England) Order 2018 SI 2018/221 & The Licensing of Houses in Multiple Occupation (Mandatory Conditions of Licenses) (England) Regulations 2018 SI 2018/616 enters into force
In respect of Qs2 and 3 above, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4.
The number of HMO license applications received in the most recent 12 month period that you hold on record
53 applications for new licences

90 applications for renewal licences

5.
The number of HMO license applications rejected in the most recent 12 month period that you hold on record. If recorded, please include a breakdown of the reason for rejection
No licence applications have been rejected.

6.
The number of HMOs you estimate will fall into the new mandatory licensing scheme when it enters into force on 1 October 2018
7.
The number of visits to HMOs conducted for the most recent 12 month period that you hold on record
In respect of above Qs6 and 7, the Council does not hold this information. This is therefore a refusal notice in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.

8.
The number of prosecutions brought against HMO landlords in the last two years. If available, a breakdown of the offence and outcome

No prosecutions against HMO landlords in last 2 years.

9.
Whether your council has taken any decisions to stop granting new HMO licenses, or cap the number of new licenses granted in the future. If so, details of the limit and the minutes of the meeting in which it was decided. 

The introduction of the Article 4 Direction to remove permitted development rights to convert a dwelling house (Class C3) to HMO (Class C3) came into force on 20th August 2014. Details of this can be found on the following link.

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/planning-and-building/planning-applications/make-an-application/article-4-directions/houses-in-multiple-occupation/
In areas where there is an Article 4 for HMO then any planning application for such a change of use would be dealt on its individual merit. The Article 4 does not set limits.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


