Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

My questions are:

1) Name of your existing software product for processing of Council Tax? 
e.g. Capita, Northgate, Civica or other, please give Company and or product name.

Civica.


2) Date of the next software licence renewal?
if a perpetual licence then the date of maintenance renewal please?
Contract commenced on 11 August 2014 for 7 years with a provision to extend by three one year period extensions. Final end date is 2024

3) Annual cost of software (Council Tax)?
i.e. software licence and or maintenance (if not separated from Housing Benefit and or NNDR, then total cost please)
Civica Open Revenues – annual cost £167,598, this is not broken down between different modules.

4) Are the printing of Council tax bills produced in-house or by external provider?
External provider.

5) The average cost to the Authority per bill produced? (To calculate cost I do not require staffing costs, so Information Technology cost, printing, postage, collating and any other direct costs, divided by the number of bills produced, please do not deduct revenue from advertisers, that may sponsor bill production).

This information is not held.  The contract above covers all correspondence sent by the revenue and benefits services across the council.  To provide a meaningful calculation regarding the cost of a single Council Tax bill would require staff to separate out the different types of correspondence covered by this cost centre.
Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

