Freedom of Information Act 2000 – exempt accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
I would be grateful if you could offer some information that the authority may have available regarding current exempt accommodation statistics in the local authority. The request refers to exempt accommodation as defined in subparagraph (10) of paragraph 4 of Schedule 3 to the Housing Benefit and Council Tax Benefit (Consequential Provisions) Regulations 2006 (SI 2006/217).

Answer - As of 1 October 2018:

1. How many individuals are currently claiming for exempt accommodation within the local authority? Please could you provide the total number, 936 in addition to the number broken down by:

a). Number of claimants accommodated by registered providers, private sector landlords and any additional types of accommodation provider. 
762 registered providers, 30 private boarder, 144 private non-regulated tenancies.

b). Number of claimants that are known to have experienced homelessness and those who have not. 
We do not record this information, although 123 are in homelessness-related accommodation.

This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

c). Claimants that are 'single' and those claiming with dependent children/ who are pregnant women. 
866 single, 25 couples without children, 45 with dependent children. Pregnancy not recorded therefore this is a refusal in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.

2. Please could you provide the current lowest, highest and average awarded eligible rents for accommodation classed as exempt. Please provide figures for the core rents, service charges and total rent inclusive of service charges.
	
	Core Rent
	Service Charge
	Total eligible rent

	Lowest (212989)
	£37.90
	£0.00
	£37.90

	Highest (368498)
	£84.15
	£322.58 eligible / £17.73 ineligible
	£406.73

	Average (280843)
	£197.42
	£0.00
	£197.42



Please note, our systems do not record the split between core rent and service charges, which can only be determined by manual checking of individual cases. Therefore, the only mean which can be provided is the median.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


