Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information.
You asked:
For 2007, 2012 and 2017 (full calendar years) can you please provide the following information? Please note this is in relation to Leicester's city centre shopping area. 

1. What was the level of business rates been for each year per square foot? 

Answer: We do not hold footage details; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. How many retail premises were closed or been left vacant? 
We can confirm that currently there are 176 shops or shops and premises vacant within the LE1 post code which is the main city centre shopping area, however, we do not hold historical data, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. What was the average council-controlled parking cost (please share the tariffs for council car parks in the city)? 
Please find this information attached.
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/184257/parking-report-august-2017.pdf
4. What was the total number of cars that used council run parking facilities and what is the maximum capacity at council run parking facilities? 
	Car  Park Capacity 

	Car Park
	2007
	2012
	2017

	Newarke St  (Multy -storey)
	476
	476
	476

	Haymarket ( Multi-storey)
	485
	485
	485

	Victoria Park Car Park
	120
	120
	237

	Granville Road 
	70
	70
	0

	Dover St 
	162
	162
	162

	Phoenix Square 
	0
	0
	50

	St . Margaret's Pastures
	125
	125
	125

	Abbey Park
	80
	80
	80

	Upper Brown Street 
	0
	0
	21

	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	1518
	1518
	1636


	Total number of car that used the car park 

	Car Park
	2007
	2012
	2017

	Newarke St  (Multy -storey)
	No data
	119,039
	128,115

	Haymarket ( Multi-storey)
	No data
	120,814
	136,875

	Victoria Park Car Park
	No data
	No data
	No data

	Granville Road 
	No data
	No data
	No data

	Dover St 
	No data
	No data
	No data

	Phoenix Square 
	No data
	No data
	No data

	St . Margaret's Pastures
	No data
	No data
	No data

	Abbey Park
	No data
	No data
	No data

	Upper Brown Street 
	No data
	No data
	No data


We do not hold the information for 2017 or for most car parks for 2012 and 2017, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5.  How many private car parks did you licence?  If the information is available, what was/is the total capacity of licensed car parks for each of these years?
This information can be found on our planning portal:
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means as it is already in the public domain, please see link below.
http://rcweb.leicester.gov.uk/planning/onlinequery/ResultSet.aspx?AppNo=&Address=&UPRN=&Wrd=&AppType=&DateRecFrm=&DateRecTo=&DateDecfrm=01/01/2010&DateDecTo=&Proposal=parking%20spaces&DecisionType=

6. What was the average single journey bus charge? 
7. What was the number of bus journeys that terminated or started in the city centre? 
This information is not collected or held by Leicester City Council. To gather this information, you would need to contact each individual bus operator within Leicester, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

8. If a local park and ride is available – what was the cost per return journey? 
	Park and Ride return ticket prices

	Year
	Adult ticket price 
	Group ticket price

	2007
	£2.60
	£3.20

	2012
	£3
	£3.50

	Jan - 3 Sept 2017
	£3
	£3.50

	from 4 Sept 2017
	£3.50
	£4


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall, 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

