Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.

You asked:

I am aware that the Government has contacted local authorities on matters connected with Brexit preparations. I am writing to request the following under the Freedom of Information Act:

1. Reports, briefings, plans or documents detailing your local authority's Brexit preparations
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. Specific reports, briefings, plans or documents detailing your local authority's preparations for a No Deal Brexit and specifically any plans produced on the issues of food supplies, medical and medicines supplies, fuel supply and other civil contingencies in the event of a No Deal Brexit
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Specific reports prepared by your local authority on the impact of Brexit for adult social care in your local authority area and any advice provided to contracted social care providers related to Brexit

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4. If your local authority has prepared no such plans 1-3, the dates by which you expect to have done so

The Council’s Audit and Risk Committee have requested an impact assessment is conducted and it is anticipated that something will be presented to the Committee at the meeting due to be held on 27 November.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

