Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1.       How many entries have been added to your register between 31 October 2017 and 30 October 2018?
Please note, a number of those registering indicated a willingness for both individual and/or group self-build so these figures should not be totaled.
a. individual [number]
35

b. group [number]

16

c. individuals within groups [number] 

This information is not recorded. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2.       How many entries on your register in total as at 30 October 2018.
Please note, a number of those registering indicated a willingness for both individual and/or group self-build so these figures should not be totaled.

a. individual [number]
94
b. group [number]

38
c. individuals within groups [number]
This information is not recorded. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3.       As at 30 October 2018 are you keeping specific records as to the number of planning permissions for serviced plots suitable for self and custom build that have been granted from 1 April 2016 to 30 October 2018 so as to track your statutory obligations?  [yes/no]
No. Consented and unexpired planning permissions for residential development can be provided on request (currently free of charge) 

a. If so, how many permissions have you granted? [number] Not applicable.
4.       Have you introduced a local connection test? [yes/no]
No, although place of residency is recorded as part of the registration process.
b. If so, from what date did this apply? [free text] Not applicable.
c. If so, how many entries on part one of the register at 30 October 2018? 
i. Individuals [number]

ii. groups [number]
Not applicable.

d. If so how many entries on part two of the register at 30 October 2018? 

i. Individuals [number]

ii. groups? [number]
Not applicable.

5.       Have you introduced a financial viability test? [yes/no]
No.
a. If so, from what date did this apply? [date]
Not applicable.

6.       Have you implemented a charge for entry onto the register? [yes/no]
No.
a. If so, what is the charge (amount, frequency)? [free text]
Not applicable.

7.       In the period from 31 October 2017 to 30 October 2018 have you publicised your register? [yes/no]
Yes.

a. If so, please provide a high- level outline to the main methods of publicity the authority has undertaken in that period? [free text]

This following information is published on our website:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/policies-plans-and-strategies/planning-and-development/land-and-building-asset-registers/
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/policies-plans-and-strategies/planning-and-development/
In addition, the profile and extent of the provision is also subject to consultation dialogue and policy development through the Council’s emerging Local Plan

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

