Freedom of Information Act 2000 – access to housing for disabled people
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How many people who've stated they have a disability and/or define themselves as disabled are currently on your authorities' waiting list for social housing or council housing? (By social or council housing, I refer to properties owned and managed by you as the local authority, whereby the recipient comes to you to be housed).
 

Answer: Based on the latest available data, there are 172 cases on the waiting list where a fully wheelchair-adapted property is required (Category A).

In addition to the above, there are a further 335 cases on the waiting list requiring partially adapted properties (Category B). This may mean that there would need to be level access, downstairs bathrooms or bedrooms or some form of stair lift.

The sum of the above would suggest there are 507 cases relating to people with a disability.

In addition to the above, there are a further 95 cases on the waiting list where people have indicated they require a ground floor property.

2. How many people in total, those with and without a disability, are currently on your waiting list for social or council housing?

5,641

 

3. How many social or council properties do you own and manage in total?

20,661

 
4. How many of the aforementioned properties have full wheelchair access?

89; an additional 1,561 are recorded as partially adapted, and a further 1,433 are recorded as ground-floor access.

5. How many of the aforementioned properties have been adapted in order to meet the needs of a disabled tenant, past or present?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


