Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1) Since 2013, how much recycling waste has the Leicester City Council produced annually?
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied namely; the information is accessible by other means and is already in the public domain.  

This information is available publically through WasteDataFlow, the national waste reporting website: http://www.wastedataflow.org/
2) What proportion of recycling that the Leicester City Council collects is contaminated?
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied namely; the information is accessible by other means and is already in the public domain.  

This information is available publically through WasteDataFlow, the national waste reporting website: http://www.wastedataflow.org/

3) How much money is lost/spent due to contaminated recycling?
The Council has an integrated Waste Management contract in which responsibility for this is borne by the contractor.  The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4) What is the most common type of recycling contamination?
Food waste, textiles, nappies, non-recyclable plastics and non-recyclable paper/card.

5) Can the amount of recycling be split into percentage of plastic, paper and cardboard and metals? 

Again, this information is available publically through WasteDataFlow, the national waste reporting website: http://www.wastedataflow.org/
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

