Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

I am working on my MSc. project which relates to analysing the spend in Special Educational Needs Service.

Top Up Funding and Travel Assistance Data

I would be grateful if you could forward the following information for 2015/16, 2016/2017, 2017/2018, 2018/2019(projected):

Top Up Funding (Element 3 )
1. annual spend and number of recipients by  - 

   * primary need

   * pre 16 ( by Key stages or year groups) - mainstream, special, Resource base, non-maintained, residential

   * post 16 - mainstream, special, Resource base, non-maintained, residential

   * ABA programme

   * gender and ethnicity 

Please see the attached supporting document.

Travel Assistance
1. annual spend and number of recipients by  - 

   * primary need

   * pre 16 - mainstream, special, Resource base, non-maintained

   * post 16 - mainstream, special, Resource base, non-maintained

   * whether single occupancy, multi occupancy or walkers

2. personal budgets for transport - total spend by service, number of recipients, total distance travelled

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We can confirm that staff have already spent in excess of 18 hours locating, retrieving and extracting the data requested. Therefore, further time spent on this FOIA will exceed the cost limit of £450 and 18 hours of officer time.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

3. number of wheelchair users

4. number of passenger assistants

	Academic Year
	No of Passenger Assistants
	No of Routes
	No of W/C users

	2015/2016
	323
	323
	129

	2016/2017
	348
	348
	139

	2017/2018
	453
	453
	142

	2018/2019
	492
	492
	132


5. number of recipients by risk levels (high, medium, low)
The Passenger and Transport Service produce a Transport Management Plan (TMP) based on the information shared with us through a child’s Educational Health Care Plan (EHCP) which we receive from the Special Educational Needs Team.

The TMP helps summarise the child’s special needs and how to manage their behaviours or health needs during transportation. These are individual plans and not categorised by risk level.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. total distance travelled by type of transport
The Council does not hold this information, Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
7. number of routes

Please see the table above.

8. state if there is a travelcard scheme

9. state if there is a travel training programme

Information regarding bus passes concessionary fares and our special needs and community transport service is available via the link below.
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/transport-and-streets/travelling-by-bus/passes-and-concessionary-fares/

Again, this is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to continue to comply with your request will exceed the appropriate 18 hour limit.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

