Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Under the Freedom of Information Act please can you provide the following information:

1) How many council refuse lorries are fitted with CCTV cameras?

How many refuse lorries does the council have?
Leicester City Council contracts its waste and recycling collections to a contractor, Biffa Leicester.  To collect the waste and recycling from the properties of the residents of Leicester the contractor operates a fleet of:

a. 30 Refuse Collection Vehicles (RCV’s) with CCTV, 

b. 4 Bulk trucks with CCTV and 

c. 3 spare RCVs with no CCTV utilised currently.

2) Between November 01,2017, to October 31, 2018, how many fines has the council issued for contaminated rubbish bins and how much did they amount to?
Can you repeat this for November 01,2016, to October 31, 2017 and November 01,2015, to October 31, 2016.
Leicester City Council does not issue fines for contaminated waste or recycling bins or bags.

3) How many incidents relating to rubbish bins has the council recorded between November 01,2017, to October 31, 2018, November 01,2016, to October 31, 2017 and November 01,2015, to October 31, 2016? incorrect recycling, ie residents putting the wrong waste in a bin? Or put out their waste at the wrong time, overload their bins, leave the lids open or fail to use slop caddies. 
No fines are issued for non-presented bins or bags, or overloaded bins.  
Open bin lids are not recorded although they may be associated with overfull and therefore overloaded bins, which cannot be emptied for Health and safety reasons.

Leicester City Council does not supply ‘slop caddies’ to any of its residents.

Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4) How much did they amount to?

Not applicable.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

