Freedom of Information Act 2000 – food poverty
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Is there a Cabinet Portfolio holder with responsibility for food poverty?

Answer: 

We have a multi-agency steering group that addresses Food Poverty. Councillors Clarke and Russell are members of this steering group. The Food Plan Board oversees this steering group. Councillor Clarke chairs the food plan board.  

2. Is the council part of a Food Partnership or Food Alliance which covers the boundaries of the council? 

Leicester has a Food Plan which works towards Leicester being a healthy and sustainable food city.  Leicester Food Plan Board is chaired by Councillor Clarke and the plan is currently being revised.
3. How many times has the Council provided support under the Financial Assistance Section 17 (s17) Children Act 1989 to tackle hunger in the last 12 months?

We do not hold this information, as Section 17s are recorded simply as that with no distinction of the primary risk.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


