Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Social Care EHCPs
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How many children taken were taken into care by your council in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
Answer: 
a. 2010


187

b. 2015


271

c. 2017


298

d. 2018 (year to date)
158 (to 26 November 2018)

 

2. What was the annual expenditure on children's services by your council in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
Please note that as Leicester City Council reports by financial years, the figures below have also been stated as financial years and not calendar years.
a. 2015 – 2015/16 - £81,294,800

b. 2016 – 2016/17 - £86,838,200

c. 2017 – 2017/18 - £86,874,700

d. 2018 (year to date) – Not Available*. Figures above for the past 3 years have been extracted from the S251 returns. As the S251 Outturn for 2018/19 will not be completed until later next year. 

 

3. What was the annual number of children eligible for foster care who were not placed with a carer (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2010 Information not available* 
b. 2015 None

c. 2017 None

d. 2018 (year to date) None

 

4. a) What was the annual expenditure spent on foster carers by your council that was spent directly in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2010 – 2010/11 - £7,667,700
b. 2015 – 2015/16 - £6,750,800

c. 2017 – 2017/18 - £8,131,100

d. 2018 (year to date) – To Nov 18 - £4,822,500

 

4. b) What was the annual expenditure spent on foster carers that was spent through Independent Foster Agencies (IFAs) in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2010 – 2010/11 - £1,430,700

b. 2015 – 2015/16 - £2,062,900

c. 2017 – 2017/18 - £3,035,100

d. 2018 (year to date) – To Nov 18 - £2,467,600

 

5.  How many requests for an assessment for an Education Health and Care Plan (EHCP) were received by your council in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year): 
a. 2015 - 295

b. 2016 - 390

c. 2017 - 467

d. 2018 (year to date) – Jan to Oct - 417

 

6. How many assessments for an EHCP were carried out by your council in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2015 - 214

b. 2016 - 252

c. 2017 - 316

d. 2018 (year to date) – Jan to Oct - 300

7. How many assessments for an EHCP which were carried out by your council in the following years took longer than 20 weeks to provide a decision to the applicant (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2015 - 141

b. 2016 - 58

c. 2017 - 113

d. 2018 (year to date) – Jan to Oct - 114

8. How many EHCPs were approved by your council in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2015 - 268

b. 2016 - 198

c. 2017 - 268

d. 2018 (year to date) – Jan to Oct - 307

9. How many EHCPs which were declined by your council after an initial assessment were later granted following appeal, in each of the following years (please provide your responses broken down by calendar year):
a. 2015 - No Records*
b. 2016 - 7

c. 2017 - 15

d. 2018 (year to date) – Jan to Oct - 12

* The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the authority.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


