Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. What percentage of all new homelessness applications are being collected and reported in accordance with the new H-CLIC data requirement (Homelessness Case Level Collection) since 3rd April 2018? 
100%.

a. If not all requirements are being met, what information is being collected on homelessness applications and how is this being reported to MHCLG?
Not applicable.


b. What percentage of legacy cases are being reported through H-CLIC since 3rd April 2018? 

0% cases are reported via P1E

2. What percentage of homelessness prevention spending is spent on: 

a. Advice and information 
b. Early identification 
c. Pre-crisis intervention
d. Preventing recurring homelessness
e. Other 
f. Total spend 

Total spend for the homelessness prevention team is as follows: £511,700.

We do not hold a breakdown of the time and resources spent on the categories requested.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. Does the local authority monitor adherence to and judge the effectiveness of its homelessness strategy? 
Yes.


a. If so, how?
Leicester City Council’s Homelessness Strategy is overseen by a robust governance structure that includes:

· Head of Service for Homelessness

· Director of Housing

· Assistant Mayor for Housing

· Housing Scrutiny Commission

In some cases, and especially during the draft and sign-off of a new Strategy, the City Mayor and his senior cabinet are involved in the decision making process.

This governance serves to ensures that the strategy serves the citizens of Leicester appropriately, and that the business change that occurs to implement the strategy objectives are effective.

4. Has any training, or advice, been provided to other public services with a duty to refer following the Homelessness Reduction Act?
Yes.

a. If so, what?
We met with each duty-holder in our area to devise referral methods and communication plans.  In most instances information was provided and the organisation conducted their own staff communication and training.  In some instances, training was provided to management.


b. Is there different advice for different services?
Yes, different advice was more pertinent for some areas, for example the changes to the local connection rules for Care Leavers were most important to the Leaving Care Team.


c. If not, are there plans in place to provide training or advice?
Not applicable.

5. Are there any data sharing agreements within the local authority, or with other local authorities, that aim to prevent homelessness? If so, what?

For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council website, and is already in the public domain
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/our-website/privacy/organisations-we-share-data-with/
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

