Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. How many teachers have been assaulted on school premises or just outside school premises in the last three years?
We have checked for incidents logged under the following categories:

· Offensive weapon used

· Physical abuse

· Physical violence

· Pulled hair

· Violent incident involving an animal

And have obtained the following results:

2016

Special – 16

Primary – 18

Secondary – 9

2017

Special – 23

Primary – 10

Secondary – 12

2018 

Special – 9

Primary – 11

Secondary – 4

2. How many teachers have been assaulted by a parent with a child at their school in the last three years?
The Council does not hold this information; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held. 

Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to a list of schools within the Authority: 

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/education-lifelong-learning/about-schools/schools-directory/schools-directory/ School ward, head teacher, telephone, e mail etc. is available by clicking on the link for each school. 

3. How much money has been paid out in compensation for teachers who have been assaulted?
2015 - Nil

2016 - Nil

2017 - Nil

2018 - Nil

4. How many teachers have been sexual harassed or assaulted on school grounds? Please specify harassment or assault.
2015 - Nil

2016 - Nil

2017 - Nil

2018 - Nil

5. How much compensation has been granted to teachers who were sexually harassed or assaulted on school grounds? 
2015 - Nil

2016 - Nil

2017 - Nil

2018 - Nil

Please provide answers in a yearly break down for the last four years (2015, 2016, 2017, 2018 to date) and provide the level of education eg. primary teacher, secondary school teacher, or sixth form teacher.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
