Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:
1.Please could you confirm the total number of road bonds called-in over the last 3 years for S278 and S38 agreements?
No bonds have been called in during the past 3 years.

2.Please could you confirm what are the individual elements that your Authority includes within their bond requirement for all highways work for S278 and S38 agreements?

The bond is intended to cover all the costs associated with the development, such as construction, design, and inspections.
3.Please could you provide an average value for bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?
A request under The FOI Act is for information that is held by an organisation, we do not hold an average value for bond provision.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4.Would you consider using the developer obtained tender value for calculating the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?
A request under The FOI Act is for information that is held by an organisation, to provide an opinion or comment is to create new information and does not fall under the remit of the Act. 

5.Please could you confirm your inspection fee or percentage applicable relevant to the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?

Our fees for section 38 and 278 agreements under the Highways Act 1980, are detailed in our Minor Fees and Charges for Transportation Services 2018/19 on our website. Therefore, an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, and is already in the public domain.
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/181997/minor-fees-and-charges-2018-2019.pdf
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

