Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Q1. For each financial year 2012/2013, 2013/2014, 2014/2015, 2015/2016, 2016/2017, 2017/2018 and 2018-present, how many S.42 safeguarding reports/enquiries have the local authorities recorded under the Care Act 2014, involving the abuse and neglect of patients under 65 years old with learning disabilities and/or autism, detained under the Mental Health Act 1983 in an NHS or independent sector hospital with a specialism in assessment or medical treatment for persons with learning disabilities and/or autism? Please list the names of the care provider and the number of reports of safeguarding incidents for each.
The Care Act was passed in 2014 and came into full effect in 2015 so data for years preceding 2015 is no held. We are able to provide data in response to the above question for part of the period requested. As noted above, the Care Act came into full effect in 2015 and only in 2017 did we integrate safeguarding activity recorded in Mental Health settings with our new case management system Liquid Logic. Data from before this integration was completed is not held.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, as information prior to 2017is not held by Leicester City Council.
Further we wish to clarify that s42 safeguarding enquiry numbers reflect the enquiries made. Enquiries may result in a conclusion that no abuse of neglect has occurred. Therefore the information provided should not be regarded as a reflection of the number of incidents of abuse; it is only a reflection of the number of investigations made.

Enquiries by provider for people aged under 65 years in a specialist Mental health setting 

	Provider
	2017/18
	2018/19 to 25.01.19

	Agnes Unit
	2
	0

	Arnold
	2
	11

	Bradgate Unit
	13
	16

	Evington Centre
	1
	1

	Herschel Prins
	0
	1

	The Willows
	1
	0

	Total
	19
	29


Q2. In connection to the above, please list the type of safeguarding enquiries/reports (as per below) for each private provider:

a. Neglect and acts of omission

b. Emotional/psychological abuse

c. Physical abuse

d. Sexual abuse

e. Medication

f. Discriminatory abuse

g. Other type of abuse as recorded by the local authority
Enquiries by provider and category of alleged abuse for people aged under 65 years in a specialist Mental health setting 2017/18

	 
	What was the nature of the alleged abuse?
	 

	Provider
	 Financial and Material
	Sexual
	Physical
	Total

	Agnes Unit
	 
	 
	2
	2

	Arnold Lodge
	1
	1
	 
	2

	Bradgate MH Unit
	1
	 
	13
	14

	The Willows
	 
	 
	1
	1

	Total
	2
	1
	16
	19


Enquiries by provider and category of alleged abuse for people aged under 65 years in a specialist Mental health setting 2018/19 from 01/04/2018 to 25/01/2019

	 
	What is the nature of the alleged abuse? 

 

	Provider
	 Emotional / Psychological
	 Neglect and Acts of Omission
	 Organisational
	 Sexual
	Physical
	Grand Total

	Agnes Unit
	 
	 
	 
	 
	1
	1

	Arnold Lodge
	 
	 
	 
	2
	9
	11

	Bradgate MH Unit 
	1
	1
	2
	2
	10
	16

	Herschel Prins Centre
	 
	 
	 
	 
	1
	1

	Grand Total
	1
	1
	2
	4
	21
	29


Q3. In connection to the above Q1 and Q2, please provide the person alleged to be responsible for the reported safeguarding report/enquiry:

a. paid employee

b. other service user

c. agency staff member

d. family member or visitor

e. outside health professional (eg doctor psychiatrist)

f. other

	Perpetrator type
	2017/18
	2018/19 to 25.01.19

	Health Care Worker
	4
	4

	Other Professional
	0
	1

	Other Vulnerable Adult
	13
	24

	Other family member
	1
	0

	stranger
	1
	0

	Total
	19
	29


Q4. In connection to Q1, please provide the number of investigations that concluded during each financial year 2012/2013, 2013/2014, 2014/2015, 2015/2016, 2016/2017, 2017/2018 and 2018-present and the number, which resulted in:

a. non-criminal investigations

b. criminal investigations
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
NB. For each of the questions, if some of the hospital settings provide services for

both patients over 65 and under, please refer to the ones under 65.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

