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Our ref:               
FOIA 17523
Date:
05 February 2019
Kerry Blakeman
kerryblakeman@hotmail.com
Dear Mr Blakeman
Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Drones
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information.
You asked:
1. In 2014 how many requests did LCC receive to fly drones/UAS on their land both for private and commercial operations?
2. 
In 2014 how many incidents were reported to LCC about nuisance drones/ UAS?
3. 
In 2015 how many requests did LCC receive to fly drones/UAS on their land both for private and commercial operations?
4. 
In 2015 how many incidents were reported to LCC about nuisance  drones/ UAS?
Answer: 

In terms of the above questions around the numbers of requests to fly drones and the number of incidents involving drones, Leicester City Council do not hold that information, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the authority.


5.
In relation to the LCC drone policy here https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/180601/drone-policy.pdf - what public consultation was carried out before the introduction of the policy?

There was no public consultation undertaken in Leicester prior to introducing the drone policy. 
It was subject to internal consultation with the following divisions within the Leicester City Council:

Business Regulation, Arts & Museums, Risk Management, Health & Safety, Festivals & Events, Licensing, Insurance, City Wardens, Regulatory Service, Parks & Open Spaces.
6.
With regards to LCC Pleasure Grounds Act here http://www.cabinet.leicester.gov.uk/documents/s12562/Parks%20Byelaws%20Appendix%202.pdf section 41 refers to 'Aircraft" - in what year was this specific reference to 'Aircraft' introduced into the bye law? 
This set of model byelaws was introduced by Leicester City Council in 2009. 
These formed part of the set of model byelaws produced by the Department for Community and Local Government (DCLG). 

Any queries regarding the content of these (such as references to Aircraft) should be clarified with the government department dealing with byelaws, namely:
Byelaws Team 
Ministry of Housing, Communities and Local Government 
2nd Floor NE, Fry Building 
2 Marsham Street 
London 
SW1P 4DF

7.
Was there any public consultation regarding the introduction of the term 'Aircraft" into the bye law?
As per question 6 above, this question would need to be directed to the Byelaws Team at the Ministry of Housing, Communities and Local Government.
8.
In 2016 how many requests did LCC receive to fly drones/UAS on their land both for private and commercial operations?
9.
In 2016 how many incidents were reported to LCC about nuisance drones/ UAS?
10.
In 2017 how many requests did LCC receive to fly drones/UAS on their land both for private and commercial operations?
11.
In 2017 how many incidents were reported to LCC about nuisance drones/ UAS?
12.
In 2018 how many requests did LCC receive to fly drones/UAS on their land both for private and commercial operations?
13.
In 2018 how many incidents were reported to LCC about nuisance drones/ UAS?
Same as Qs1-4 above, the Council does not hold this information and is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Yours sincerely

Pravina Chandarana
Information Governance Officer
Tell us how we’re doing: We would be very grateful if you could answer a few short questions in this anonymous online survey about our response to you so that we can continue to improve our services.
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