Freedom of Information Act 2000 – elderly social care
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
Please note that Leicester City Council’s responses to Q1 and Q2 relate directly to those Care homes in the City that the Council contract with. This is not indicative of all care homes in the local authority area.

You asked:
1. What overall number of care home beds for over 65 year olds (in total and for nursing beds) were occupied/vacant in the Leicester City local authority area? Please fill in the following table.
Answer: Please note that the Council do not categorise or record care home places by age group. 
Whilst some care homes we contract with specifically target particular service-user groups (e.g. Older People, Learning Disabilities, Mental Health etc), any service user could take up a care place in any contract home. 
Hence, numbers cited below are not representative of over 65s, but are for the entire contracted portfolio.

Also, please note the revised ‘as at’ dates, from which this data is extracted from. 
The Council have a weekly monitoring process for vacancies in residential/nursing care, and in response to this FOIA have selected the nearest date to the first of each month. We currently hold data up to 11/01/2019, which forms our ‘current’ position.

Also, please note that in accordance with the question, the table relating to table 1 looks at gross capacity/vacancy in care homes in our local authority area (that are contracted to Leicester City Council), regardless of funding source.

	Total
	Jan. 2016

08/01/2016
	July 2016

01/07/2016
	Jan. 2017

06/01/2017
	Jan. 2017

07/07/2017
	July 2018

02/01/2018
	July 2018

06/07/2018
	Currently

11/01/2019

	Total number of occupied care beds for over 65s.
	2415
	2430
	2426
	2413
	2345
	2456
	2427

	Total number of vacant care beds for over 65s.
	192
	171
	167
	162
	230


	234
	177

	Total number of care beds for over 65s.
	2607
	2593
	2593
	2575
	2575
	2690
	2604

	Nursing
	Jan. 2016

08/01/2016
	July 2016

01/07/2016
	Jan. 2017

06/01/2017
	Jan. 2017

07/07/2017
	July 2018

02/01/2018
	July 2018

06/07/2018
	Currently

11/01/2019

	Number of occupied nursing care beds for over 65s.
	805
	869


	870


	837
	768
	776
	790

	Number of vacant nursing care beds for over 65s.
	96
	56
	55
	30
	99
	107
	94

	Total number of nursing care beds for over 65s.
	901
	925
	925
	867
	867
	883


	883


2. What number of care home residents over the age of 65 who currently have their care home fees paid by the local authority? Please complete the table below. 
	
	Jan. 2016


	July 2016
	Jan. 2017
	Jan. 2017

July 2017
	July 2018

Jan.18
	July 2018
	Currently

04/02/2019

	Number of fully funded care beds for over 65s.
	838
	841
	833
	795
	798
	803
	761

	Number of partially funded care beds for over 65s.
	155
	160
	160
	148


	143
	139
	149

	Number of privately funded care beds for over 65s.
	*We do not hold this data
	*We do not hold this data
	*We do not hold this data
	*We do not hold this data
	*We do not hold this data
	*We do not hold this data
	*We do not hold this data


*The requested information is not held by Leicester City Council and we are informing you of this as required by the provision of Section 1(1) of the FOIA.

3. What are the standard fees rates for Local Authority funded care home beds for the over 65s for both Nursing and Residential Care? Please complete the following table. 

	
	Jan. 2016
	July 2016
	Jan. 2017
	July 2017
	Jan. 2018
	July 2018
	Currently

	Residential care beds fee rates for over 65s.
	Lower = £399

Higher = £445
	Lower = £426

Higher = £475
	Lower = £426

Higher = £475
	Lower = £461

Higher = £518
	Lower = £461

Higher = £518
	Lower = £483

Higher = £543
	Lower = £483

Higher = £543

	Nursing care beds fee rates for over 65s.
	£434 pw (Exc of FNC)
	£463 pw (Exc of FNC)
	£463 pw (Exc of FNC)
	£489 pw (Exc of FNC)
	£489 pw

(Exc of FNC)
	£513pw (Exc of FNC)
	£513 pw

(Exc of FNC)




4. Do these fee rates vary based on the quality of care or the facilities available? If yes, please give details.

No
5. What number of care home occupants over the age 65, are currently funded by the NHS (either directly or through a clinical Commissioning Group/ Continuing Healthcare)? 

Figures for Continuing Healthcare are not readily available.  The Council does not hold any information and is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act.
At the present time NHS contributions in respect of Funding Nursing Care are paid for 164 service users.
6. What number of local authority funded residents pay a top up fee?

As at 04/02/2019, a total of 152 local authority funded residents pay a top up fee (all age groups)
7. Are the care home rooms for over 65 year olds required to have any of the following in order for a resident funded by the local authority to be placed there:
a. An en-suite WC?
No
b. Single occupancy room (excluding couples)? No
 

c. A minimum care regulatory rating?  Yes (Good) 
Although user choice may result in placements where the grading is ‘Requires Improvement’ 
d. Any additional criteria? Not suspended due to contractual issues 
8. In the last complete financial year, how much money did the local authority spend on all forms of social care and support? Please may you also include the dates that your financial year covers?

1st April 2017 to 31st March 2018 (Financial Year 2017/18). The gross amount spent on Social Care & Support (long and short term) was £107.2m 

9. Of the amount mentioned in question 8, how much of this was spent on social care for the over 65s, including all forms of social care and support?

The gross amount spent on over 65s was £53.7m

10. Of the amount mentioned in question 9, how much of this was spent on care homes for the over 65s?

The gross amount spent on care homes (residential and nursing) for over 65s was £25.0m

11. Currently, how many over 65 year olds who receive local authority funding for a care home bed, are placed outside the local authority boundary? 

As at 04/02/2019, a total of 104 people aged 65 or over who receive local authority funding for a care home bed, were placed outside the local authority boundary
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


