Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Q1a. Please provide the number of staff employed (headcount and WTE) on 01/01/2010 and 01/01/2019.  If it is not possible to provide this information for the specified dates, please provide information for the nearest possible dates, specifying which dates used.  Please do not include casual staff in the counts. 
We moved to a specific reporting system in 2014, prior to this, the information requested was not held in a reportable format.

	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Staff employed 01/01/2014
	7430
	6163.9

	Staff employed 01/01/2019
	5811
	4870.1


For the questions below we have counted our Learning Services and Adult Skills & Learning Divisions as Education (as we don’t include schools)

Q1b.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q1a by service group as below:

• Education

• Environmental Services

• Housing

• Social Care

• Other service groups

	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Staff employed 01/01/2014 in Education
	911
	581.67

	Staff employed 01/01/2014 in Environmental Services
	624
	564

	Staff employed 01/01/2014 in Housing
	1211
	1101.5

	Staff employed 01/01/2014 in Social Services
	2388
	1969.8

	Staff employed 01/01/2014  in Other service groups
	2296
	1946.81


	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Staff employed 01/01/2019 in Education
	743
	476.07

	Staff employed 01/01/2019 in Environmental Services
	642
	558.4

	Staff employed 01/01/2019 in Housing
	1004
	903.6

	Staff employed 01/01/2019 in Social Services
	1415
	1224.3

	Staff employed 01/01/2019  in Other service groups
	2007
	1707.58


Q1c.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q1a by gender
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Male staff employed 01/01/2014
	2961
	2697.6

	Female staff employed 01/01/2014
	4469
	3466.4


	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Male staff employed 01/01/2019
	2390
	2178.8

	Female staff employed 01/01/2019
	3421
	2691.2


Q1d.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q1a into the following 3 categories:-

• White staff

• BAME staff 

• Staff of unknown ethnicity
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	White staff employed 01/01/2014
	4585
	3870.4

	BAME staff employed 01/01/2014
	2423
	1967.4

	Staff of unknown ethnicity employed 01/01/2014
	422
	326


	
	Headcount
	WTE

	White staff employed 01/01/2019
	3383
	2888.1

	BAME staff employed 01/01/2019
	2056
	1678.3

	Staff of unknown ethnicity employed 01/01/2019
	372
	303.6


Q1e. Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q1a into the following 3 categories:-

• Disabled staff

• Non-disabled staff

• Staff of unknown disability status
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Disabled staff employed 01/01/2014
	533
	454.5

	Non-disabled staff employed 01/01/2014
	6300
	5215.9

	Staff of unknown disability status employed 01/01/2014
	597
	493.5


	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Disabled staff employed 01/01/2019
	381
	317.6

	Non-disabled staff employed 01/01/2019
	4859
	4079.6

	Staff of unknown disability status employed 01/01/2019
	571
	472.8


Q1f. Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q1a into the following 3 categories:-  

• LGBT+ (non-heterosexual)

• heterosexual

• Staff of unknown sexual orientation
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	LGBT+ staff employed 01/01/2010
	
	

	Heterosexual staff employed 01/01/2010
	
	

	Staff of unknown sexual orientation employed 01/01/2010
	
	


	
	Headcount
	WTE

	LGBT+ staff employed 01/01/2019
	
	

	Heterosexual staff employed 01/01/2019
	
	

	Staff of unknown sexual orientation employed 01/01/2019
	
	


The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Q2a. Please provide the number of staff (headcount, WTE) taking redundancy (whether compulsory or voluntary) between 01/01/2010 and 31/12/2018.  If you are not able to provide figures for the entire date period, please provide figures for the portion of the date range for which figures are available, specifying the period covered. 01/01/2014 – 31/12/2018
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Number of staff taking redundancy
	778
	619.7


Q2b. Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q2a broken down by gender
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Male staff taking redundancy
	287
	249.48

	Female staff taking redundancy
	491
	373.23


Q2c.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q2a into the following 3 categories:-

• White staff

• BAME staff 

• Staff of unknown ethnicity

	
	Headcount
	WTE

	White staff taking redundancy
	479
	391.04

	BAME staff taking redundancy
	252
	189.88

	Staff of unknown ethnicity taking redundancy
	47
	38.78


Q2d.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q2a into the following 3 categories:-

• Disabled staff

• Non-disabled staff

• Staff of unknown disability status
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Disabled staff taking redundancy
	69
	54.84

	Non-disabled staff taking redundancy
	634
	499.93

	Staff of unknown disability status taking redundancy
	75
	64.93


Q3a. Please provide the number of staff (headcount and  WTE) taking compulsory redundancy between 01/01/2010 and 31/12/2018.  If you are not able to provide figures for the entire date period, please provide figures for the portion of the date range for which figures are available, specifying the period covered. 01/01/2014 and 31/12/2018
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Number of staff taking compulsory redundancy
	260
	207.25


Q3b. Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q3a broken down by gender
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Male staff taking compulsory redundancy
	87
	76.54

	Female staff taking compulsory redundancy
	173
	130.71


Q3c.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q3a into the following 3 categories:-

• White staff

• BAME staff 

• Staff of unknown ethnicity
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	White staff taking compulsory redundancy
	142
	117.73

	BAME staff taking compulsory redundancy
	101
	77.01

	Staff of unknown ethnicity taking compulsory redundancy
	17
	12.50


Q3d.  Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q3a into the following 3 categories:-

• Disabled staff

• Non-disabled staff

• Staff of unknown disability status
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Disabled staff taking compulsory redundancy
	27
	20.81

	Non-disabled staff taking compulsory redundancy
	210
	168.33

	Staff of unknown disability status taking compulsory redundancy
	23
	18.10


Q4a. Please provide the number of staff (headcount, WTE) who were TUPE transferred from the local authority between 01/01/2014 and 31/12/2018.  If you are not able to provide figures for the entire date period, please provide figures for the portion of the date range for which figures are available, specifying the period covered.
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Number of staff TUPE transferred
	241
	150.9


Q4b.   Please provide a breakdown of the figures in Q4a by service group as below

• Education

• Environmental Services

• Housing

• Social Care

• Other service groups
	
	Headcount
	WTE

	Staff working in Education
	84
	35.10

	Staff working in Environmental Services
	0
	0

	Staff working in in Housing
	0
	0

	Staff working in Social Services
	133
	96.18

	Staff working  in Other service groups
	24
	19.7


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

