Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
 

Please provide the following information for the financial year 2017-18:

1. How many complaints did the council receive that related to conditions in private rented homes?
Answer: 802

2. How many inspections of private rented homes did the council carry out?
207

3. How many Category 1 Hazards were found during inspections of private rented homes?
The findings of inspections of private rented homes are not categorised using the Category Hazard scheme. The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. How many 
a) Improvement Notices 
18
b) Prohibition Orders and 
0 [6 prohibition notices]
c) Emergency Remedial Action Notices did the council issue in relation to private rented homes?
0

5. How many successful prosecutions of private landlords or agents for offences relating to rented housing did the council serve?
0

6. How many a) notices of intent and b) final notices relating to civil penalties for housing offences did the council impose?
0

7. How many Rent Repayment Orders did the council a) successfully apply for and b) assist an occupier to apply for?

0
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

